ORDINANCE N2-16-122

AN ORDINANCE OF THE MAYOR AND COMMON COUNCIL OF THE
TOWN OF DEWEY-HUMBOLDT, COUNTY OF YAVAPAI, ARIZONA,
DECLARING THE DOCUMENT ENTITLED “TOWN OF DEWEY-
HUMBOLDT, ARIZONA, BUILDING AND CONSTRUCTION CODES,
JANUARY 5, 2016” AS A PUBLIC RECORD; ADOPTING THE “TOWN
OF DEWEY-HUMBOLDT, ARIZONA BUILDING AND CONSTRUCTION
CODES, JANUARY 5, 2016” BY REFERENCE; AMENDING THE TOWN
OF DEWEY-HUMBOLDT, ARIZONA CODE OF ORDINANCES, TITLE
XV LAND USES, CHAPTER 150 BUILDING CODES BY REPEALING §§
150.01 ADMINISTRATIVE CODE, AS AMENDED, 150.02 BUILDING
CODE, AS AMENDED, 150.03 RESIDENTIAL ONE- AND TWO-
FAMILY DWELLING CODE, AS AMENDED, 150.04 PLUMBING CODE
AS AMENDED, 150.05 MECHANICAL CODE, AS AMENDED, 150.06
ELECTRICAL CODE, AS AMENDED, 150.07 FUEL GAS CODE, AS

AMENDED, 150.08 PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE, AS
AMENDED, AND 150.011 EFFECTIVE DATE; AND ADOPTING NEW

§§ 150.01 ADMINISTRATIVE CODE, 150.02 BUILDING CODE,
150.03  RESIDENTIAL CODE _FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY
DWELLINGS, 150.04 PLUMBING CODE, 150.05 MECHANICAL CODE,
150.06 ELECTRICAL CODE, 150.07 FUEL GAS CODE, 150.08
PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE ALL RELATED TO ADOPTING
AND AMENDING THE 2012 EDITIONS OF THE INTERNATIONAL
BUILDING CODE, RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY
DWELLINGS, INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE, INTERNATIONAL
MECHANICAL CODE, INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE, AND
INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE, AND THE ICC
ELECTRICAL CODE, ADMINISTRATIVE PROVISIONS, 2006 EDITION
AND NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE, 2011 EDITION; PROVIDING
FOR A SAVINGS CLAUSE; PROVIDING FOR REPEAL OF

CONFLICTING ORDINANCES; AND PROVIDING PENALTIES.

Whereas, that certain document entitled “Town of Dewey-Humboldt, Arizona Building and
Construction Codes, dated January 5, 2016”, three copies of which are on file in the office of
the Town Clerk, is hereby declared to be a public record and at least three copies or one copy
and one electronic copy are hereby ordered to remain on file with the Town Clerk; and

Whereas, the Town Council has determined that the proposed amendments will update the

Town’s-building-and-eenstruction-codes;and-are-in-the-best-interest-of-the-publichealthsafety
and general welfare of the Town to adopt the proposed codes and amendments;

Now, Therefore, Be it ordained by the Mayor and Common Council of the Town of
Dewey-Humboldt, Arizona, as follows:

TFile: 1908-003-0060-0000; Dasc: Adoption of 2012 Technical Codes - Ordinanice 12-22-15; Doc#: 249225v2




Section . In General

The Town of Dewey-Humboldt, Arizona, Code of Ordinances, Title XV Land Uses,
Chapter 150 Building Codes is hereby amended by repealing §§ 150.01 Administrative Code,
as Amended, 150.02 Building Code, as Amended, 150.03 Residential One-_and Two-Family
Dwelling Code, as Amended, 150.04 Plumbing Code, as Amended, 150.05 Mechanical Code, as
Amended, 150.06 Electrical Code, as Amended, 150.07 Fuel Gas Code, as Amended, 150.08
Property Maintenance Code, as Amended, and 150.011 Effective Date;

The Town of Dewey-Humboldt, Arizona, Code of Ordinances, Title XV Land Uses,
Chapter 150 Building Codes is hereby amending hy adding new §§ 150.01 Administrative Code,
150.02 Building Code, 150.03 Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Pwellings, 150.04
Plumbing Code, 150.05 Mechanical Code, 150.06 Electrical Code, 150.07 Fuel Gas Code, and
150.08 Property Maintenance Code, all as set forth in that document entitled “Town of Dewey-
Humboldt, Arizona, Building and Construction Codes, January 5, 2016”, which document is
hereby adopted and incorporated by reference.

Section 1. Savings Clause

If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, phrase, or portion of this Ordinance
as amended is for any reason held to be invalid or unconstitutional by the decision of any court
of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remainder of this
Ordinance.

Section I, Repeal of Conflicting Ordinance

All other code provisions, ordinances, or parts of ordinances in conflict with the
provisions of this Ordinance are hereby repealed as of the effective date hereof.

Section IV. Penalties

Any person found responsible for violating any provision of this Ordinance shall
be subject to the civil sanctions and criminal penalties provided for in the Dewey-
Humboldt Code of Ordinances, §§ 153.019, 153.020, and 153.999 uniess otherwise
provided in the Town of Dewey-Humboldt, Arizona Building and Construction Codes,
dated January 5, 2016.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Mayor and Common Council of the Town of
Dewey-Humboldt, Arizona, this 5th day of January, 2016, by the following vote:

AYES: dﬁ

ABSENT: /

¥

T— oy
EXCUSED: m ABSTAINED: (?f

7= 7

NAYES:

Page2of3
File; 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption o 2012 Technical Codes - Ordinance 12-22-15; Docll: 249225v2



APPROVED this ﬁday of \ &ﬁa ﬁimjj( , 2016,
Qﬁ/{/&%{—) X A

Teffy Nolan, May.

ATTEST:
{iww. v ‘.‘j?. T:‘ ey : 7 AJ2
Jud%ﬁll’orgaﬂrown Clerkd

e Gad.

Gust Rosenfeld, P.L.C.
Town Attorneys
By Susan D. Goodwin

IRy

l, JUDY MORGAN, TOWN CLERK, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THAT A TRUE AND CORRECT COPY OF THE
ORDINANCE NO./_'@:[ZL ADOPTED BY THE COMMON COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF DEWEY-

HUMBOLDT, ARIZONA ON THE A72DAY OFg&mﬁJ 2016, WAS POSTED IN THREE
PLACES ON THE 4#% DAY OF 2016

gandfﬁ'\ﬁfn Clerk ©

Page 3 of 3
File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Technical Codes - Ordinance 12-22-15; Dock: 249225v2



Town of Dewey-Humboldt, Arizona
Building and Construction Codes
January 5, 2016

L The Town of Dewey-Humboldt, Arizona Code of Ordinances, Title XV Land.
Usage, Chapter 150 Building Codes, Subchapter Codes Adopted, § 150.01 Administrative Code,
As Amended is hereby repealed in its entirety and new § 150.01 Administrative Code is adopted
to read as follows:

§150.01 ADMINISTRATIVE CODE

(A)  Administrative Code adopted. That certain code entitled International Building Code,
2012 Edition, Chapter 1 Scope and Administration, published by the International Code Council,
together with the amendments set forth in Subsection (B) of this Section is hereby adopted as the
Town of Dewey Humboldt Administrative Code and made a part hereof as if fully set forth
herein, governing the conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings and structures;
providing standards for supplied utilities and facilities and other physical things and conditions
essential to ensure that structures are safe, sanitary, and fit for occupation and use, and the
condemnation of buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy and use and the demolition
of such structures; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; and
providing procedures for enforcement thereof,

(B)  Amendments:
Chapter 1 Administration

Section 101 General

_Subsection 101.1 Title is deleted in its entirety and revised to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Town of Dewey-Humboldt
Administrative Code, and shall be referred herein as “this code.”

Section 101.2 Scope is amended by deletion of Exceptions and insertion of new Exceptions to
read as follows:

101.2 Scope.

Exceptions. Except as specifically limited or exempted, this code and the technical
codes shall apply to all construction within the Town of Dewey-Humboldt:

1. Federal Land. Private development on Federal land shall not be exempted.

2. Indian Tribal Land.
3. Items pursuant to A.R.S. Title 9

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v9




A, The provisions of this chapter shall not be construed to apply to:

1. Construction or operation incidental to construction and repair to
irrigation and drainage ditches or appurtenances thereto, of regularly
constituted districts or reclamation districts, or to farming, dairying,
agriculture, viticulture, horticulture or stock or poultry raising, or clearing
or other work upon land in rural areas for fire prevention purposes.

2. Devices used in manufacturing, processing ot fabricating normally
considered as involved in industry and construction, operation and
maintenance of electric, gas or other public utility systems operated by
public service corporations operating under a franchise or certificate of
convenience and necessity.

B. Notwithstanding subsection A, the requirements of this chapter apply to
the use or occupation of land or improvements by a person or entity
consisting of or including changing, remanufacturing or treating human
sewage or sludge for distribution or resale.

Section 101.2.1 Appendices is deleted in its entirety and revised to read as follows:

101.2.1 Appendices. Provisions in the appendices shall not apply unless specifically
adopted by ordinance for each referenced technical code.

Section 101.2.2 Amendment is added as an additional section to read as follows:

101.2.2 Amendment. This document and the referenced technical codes may be
amended from time to time by ordinance.

—Section 1014 Referenced Codes is‘deleted inits-entivety-and replaced by the followig: ==

101.4.1 Referenced Technical Codes. The technical codes listed in Sections 101.4.1
through 101.4.13 and referenced elsewhere in this code and as adopted by the Town of
Dewey-Humboldt shall be considered part of the requirements of this code to the
prescribed extent of each such reference.

101.4.2 Building Code. The provisions of the 2012 Edition of the International Building
Code shall apply to the construction, alteration, relocation, enlargement, replacement

repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location, maintenance, removal and demolition of
buildings or structures or any appurtenances connected or attached to such buildings or
structures.

101.4.3 Residential Code. The provisions of the 2012 Edition of the International

2

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Dese: Adoption of 2012 Tech Cedes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doci: 242292v0




Residential Code for One-and Two-Family Dwellings shall apply to the construction,
alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment use and occupancy,
location, removal and demolition of detached one-and two family dwellings and multiple
single-family dwellings and their accessory structures.

101.4.4 Plumbing Code. The provisions of the 2012 Edition of the International
Plumbing Code shall apply to the installation, alteration, repair and replacement of
plumbing systems, including equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances,
and where connected to a water or sewage system and all aspects of a medical gas
system,

101.4.5 Mechanical Code. The provisions of the 2012 Edition of the International
Mechanical Code shall apply to the installation, alterations, repairs and replacement of
mechanical systems, including equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and/or
appurtenances, including ventilation, heating, cooling, air conditioning and refrigeration
systems, incinerators and other energy-related systems.

101.4.6 Electrical Code. The provisions of the ICC Electrical Code, Administrative
Provisions, 2006 Edition and the 2011 Edition of the National Electrical Code shall apply
to the installation of electrical systems, including alterations, repairs, replacement,
equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances thereto.

101.4.7 Gas Code. The provisions of the 2012 Edition of the International Fuel Gas
Code shall apply to the installation of gas piping from the point of delivery, gas
appliances and related accessories as covered in this code. These regulations apply to gas
piping systems extending from the point of delivery to the inlet connections of appliances
and the installation and operation of residential and commercial gas appliances and
related accessories.

101.4.8 Property Maintenance Code. The provisions of the 2012 Edition of the
International Property Maintenance Code shall apply to existing structures and premises,
equipment and facilities; light, ventilation, space heating, sanitation, life and fire safety
hazards; responsibilities of owners, operators and occupants, and occupancy of exisiing
premises and structures. These provisions shall also apply to detached one-and two-
family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses) and their accessory
structures. The provisions of the 2012 Edition of the /nternational Existing Building

Code shall apply to the repair, alteration, change of occupancy and relocation of existing
buildings.

101.4.9 Grading Code. The provisions of the Grading Code, as adopted and amended in
§ 150,09 of the Dewey-Humboldt Code of Ordinances and Town of Dewey-Humboldt
Ordinance 07-31 shall apply to excavation, grading, and earthwork construction,

3

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Dese: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v9




including fills, and embankments pertaining to all aspects of grading construction on
private property.

101.4.10 Energy Code. The provisions of the 2006 Edition of the International Energy
Conservation Code, as adopted and amended in § 150.10 of the Town of Dewey-
Humboldt Code of Ordinances and Town of Dewey-Humboldt Ordinance 09-48 shall
apply to all matters governing the design and construction of buildings for energy
efficiency.

101.4.11 Fire Protection (Fire Codes). The provisions of adopted fire codes as enforced
by the Central Yavapai Fire District having approved avthorization granted by the State
of Arizona Office of the State Fire Marshall shall apply to matters affecting or relating to
fire prevention. Such current regulations and ordinances shall apply to matters affecting
or relating to structures, processes and premises from the hazard of fire and explosion
arising from the storage, handling or use of structures, materials or devices; from
conditions hazardous to life, property or public welfare in the occupancy of structures or
premises; and from construction, extension, repair, alteration or removal of fire
suppression, automatic sprinkler systems and alarms systems or fire hazards in the
structure or on the premises from occupancy or operation. These provisions as hereby
amended for fire prevention shall also apply to detached one-and two family dwellings
and multiple single family dwellings and their accessory structures.

Section 102 Applicability and Definitions
Sub-subsection 102.4.1 Conflicts is amended to add the following exception to read as follows:

102.4.1 Conflicts,

FException. Where enforcement of any code provision would violate the conditions

of approved listings of equipment or material, the conditions of the listing and the
manufacturer’s installation instructions of listed equipment or material may be
considered by the building official.

Subsection 102.6 Existing Structures is amended to read as follows:

102.6 Existing Structures. The legal occupancy of any structure existing on the date of
adoption of this code shall be permitted to continue without change, except as is

specitically covered in this code, the International Propetty Maintenance Code, or as 1s
deemed necessary by the building official for the general safety and welfare of the
occupants and the public.

Subsection 102.7 Existing Building Systems is added as a new section to read as follows:

4

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v9



102.7 Existing Building Systems, Plumbing, fuel gas, mechanical or electrical systems
lawfully in existence at the time of the adoption of this code shall be permitted to have
their use and maintenance continued if the use, maintenance or repair is in accordance
with the original design and no hazard to life, health or property is created by such
existing systems.

Subsection 102.8 Additions, Alterations or Repairs is added as a new section to read as
follows:

102.8 Additions, Alterations or Repairs. Additions, alterations or repairs to any
structure or mechanical, plumbing, fuel gas or electrical systems shall conform to the
requirements for a structure or system without requiring the existing structure or system
to comply with all requirements of this code, unless otherwise stated. Additions,
alterations or repairs shall not cause an existing structure or system to become unsafe,
hazardous, overloaded or adversely affect the performance of the structure or system.

Subsection 102.9 Historic Buildings is added as a new section to read as follows:

102.9 Historic Buildings. The provisions of this code relating to the construction,
alteration, repair, enlargement, restoration, relocation or moving of buildings or structures
shall not be mandatory for existing buildings or structures identified and classified by the
state as historic buildings or as is deemed necessary by the building official for the
general safety and welfare of the occupants and the public regarding any proposed
construction, alteration, repair, enlargement, restoration, relocation or moving of
buildings.

Subsection 102.10 Change in Occupancy is added as a new section to read as follows:

102.10 Change in Occupancy. .. It shall be unlawful to make ge-in.the occupancy... ...

of any structure which will subject the structure to any special provisions of this code
applicable to the new occupancy without approval. The building official shall certify that
such structures meets the intent of the provisions of law governing building construction
for the proposed new occupancy and that such a change of occupancy does not result in
any hazard to the public health, safety or welfare.

Subsection 102.11 Moved Buildings is added as a new section to read as follows:

102.11 Moved Buildings. Except as determined by section 102.7, plumbing, fuel gas,
mechanical, or electrical systems that are a part of buildings or structures moved into or
within the jurisdiction shall comply with provisions of this code for new installations.

Subsection 102.12 Maintenance is added as a new section to read as follows:

5

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Dese: Adoption of 2012 Tech Cedes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Docf: 242292v0




102.12 Maintenance. Mechanical, Plumbing, Fuel Gas and Electrical systems, both
existing and new, and parts thereof shall be maintained in proper operational condition in
accordance with the original design and in a safe and sanitary condition. Devices or
safeguards which are required by this code shall be maintained in compliance with the
code edition under which they were installed. The owner or the owner’s designated agent
shall be responsible for maintenance of all systems. To determine compliance with this
provision, the building official shall have the authority to require a system to be
inspected.

SECTION 102.13 Definitions is added as a new section to read as follows:

102.13 Definitions. For the purpose of this code, certain terms, phrases, words and their
derivatives shall be construed as specified in this section. The definition within the specific
adopted technical codes shall be construed to apply to that code. Where terms are not
defined through the methods authorized by this section, such terms shall have the ordinarily
accepted meaning such as the context implies. Webster’s Third New International
Dictionary of the English Language, Unabridged, shall be considered as providing
ordinarily accepted meaning.

ADDITION. An extension or increase in floor area or height of a building or structure.

ADMINISTRATIVE BUILDING CODE. The Town of Dewey-Humboldt
Administrative Building Code as set forth in the Code of Ordinances as amended and
adopted by the Town of Dewey-Humboldt Council,

ALTER or ALTERATION. Any construction or renovation to an existing structure
other than repair or addition.

APPROVED, Acceptable.to.the building official or authority having jurisdiction... ... ... .

APPROVED AGENCY. An established and recognized agency regularly engaged in
conducting tests or furnishing inspection services, when such agency has been approved
by the building official.

BASEMENT, UNFINISHED. An unheated portion or area not intended as a habitable
space and limited to storage, housing of mechanical equipment, general work area or
similar uses.

BEDROOM. A room intended for sleeping that contains an approved means of egress, a
smoke detector, and a closet.

BUILDING. Any structure used or intended for supporting or sheltering any use or
occupancy.

6

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12.22-15; Doct: 242292v9




BUILDING CODE., The International Building Code as published by the International
Code Council, as adopted by this jurisdiction,

BUILDING, EXISTING. Any building erected prior to the adoption of this code, or
one for which a legal building permit has been issued.

BUILDING OFFICIAL. The officer or other designated authority charged with the
administration and enforcement of this code, or duly authorized representative.

CARPORTS. A covered structure intended for parking of a vehicle that is open entirely
on at least two sides.

CONDOMINIUM. Real estate, portions of which are designated for separate
ownership and the remainder of which is designated for common ownership solely by the
owners of the separate portions. Real Estate is not a condominium unless the undivided
interests in the common elements are vested in the unit owners.

COMMERCIAL PROJECTS. Any commercial buildings, industrial buildings,
assembly buildings, and multi- family residential structures not defined as a townhouse
greater than a duplex.

DETACHED BUILDING. A stand-alone structure that is separated from other
structures on the same property without fire resistant constructed exterior walls with a
physical separation.

DWELLING. A building that contains one or two dwelling units used, intended, or
designed to be used, rented, leased, let or hired out to be occupied for living purposes

DWELLING UNIT. A single unit providing complete, independent living facilities for

sanitation and may or may not have cooking facilities.

ELECTRICAL CODE. The National Electrical Code published by the National Fire
Protection Association, as adopted by this jurisdiction.

EXISTING BUILDING CODE. The International Existing Building Code, published
by the International Code Council, as adopted by this jurisdiction.

FUEL GAS CODE. The Infernafional Fuel Gas Code, published by the Infernafional
Code Council, as adopted by this jurisdiction.

GRADING. Any excavating, filling, or combination thereof for earthwork construction
as covered within the grading ordinance as adopted by this jurisdiction.

7

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doo#: 242292v9

one or more persons; including permanent-provision-for living; sleeping;-eating; === e =




JURISDICTION. The governmental unit that has adopted this code under due
legislative authority.

LISTED and LISTING. Terms referring to equipment that is shown in a list published
by an approved testing agency qualified and equipped for experimental testing and
maintaining an adequate periodic inspection of current products and whose listing states
that the equipment complies with nationally recognized standards when installed in
accordance with the manufacturer's installation instructions.

MECHANICAL CODE. The International Mechanical Code published by the
International Code Council, as adopted by this jurisdiction.

OCCUPANCY. The purpose for which a building, or part thereof, is used or intended to
be used.

OWNER. Any person, agent, firm or corporation having a legal or equitable interest in
the property.

PERMIT. An official document or certificate issued by the authority having jurisdiction
which authorizes performance of a specified activity.

PERSON. An individual, heirs, executors, administrators or assigns, and also includes a
firm, partnership or corporation or their successors or assigns, or the agent of any of the
aforesaid.

PLUMBING CODE. The International Plumbing Code, published by the International
Code Council, as adopted by this jurisdiction.

REPAIR. The reconstruction or renewal of any part of an existing building, structure or
building service-equipment for-the purpose-ofits-maintenance, - ----

RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS. The
International Residential Code for one- and two-family dwellings, published by the
International Code Council, as adopted by this jurisdiction.

SHALL. The term, when used in this code, is construed as mandatory.

STRUCTURE. That which is built or constructed, an edifice or building of any kind, or

afly piece of work artificially builtup or comiposcd of parts joinied together in some
definite manner,

TECHNICAL CODES. Those codes adopted by this jurisdiction containing the
provisions for design, construction, alteration, addition, repair, removal, demolition, use,
location, occupancy and maintenance of all buildings and structures and building service

8

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#f: 242292v9



equipment as herein defined.

TOWNHOUSE. A single-family dwelling unit constructed in a group of three or more
attached units in which each unit extends from the foundation to roof and with a yard or
public way (open space) on at least two sides.

TRAILER (PARK MODEL). A park trailer built on a single chassis, mounted on
wheels and designed to be connected to utilities necessary for operation of installed
fixtures and appliances and has a gross trailer area of not less than three hundred twenty
(320} square feet and not more than four hundred (400) square feet when it is set up, and
manufactured to comply with ANSI A119.5 standards, except that it does not include
recreational vehicles, travel trailers, campers or fifth wheel trailers.

VALUATION or VALUE. The total estimated cost to replace, repair, build, or erect any
building and its building service equipment in kind, based on current construction costs.

YURT OR TENT. A membrane structure,
Subsection 102,14 Guideline Manuals is hereby added as a new section to read as follows;

102.14 Guideline Manuals. Guideline manuals as published by the International Code
Council, Inc. and The National Fire Protection Association, Inc. as commentaries,
handbooks, inspection guides, plan review guides, training manuals and other such
reference publications may be used by the building official as guidance to provide
alternative approaches to achieve compliance and interpretations of the technical codes.

Section 104 Duties and Powers of Building Official

Subsection 104.5 Identification is hereby deleted in its entirety and revised to read as follows:

104.5 Identification. The building official and appointed deputies shall carry proper
identification when inspecting structures or premises in the performance of duties under
this code.

Subsection 104.7 Department Records is hereby amended by the revision of the first sentence to
read as follows:

104.7 Department Records. The building official shall have access to official records of

applications received, permits and certificates issued, fees collected, réports of inspections,
and notices and orders issued.

Sub-subsection 104.190.1 Flood Hazard Areas is hereby deleted in its entirety and revised to read

as follows:

9

File: 19508-003-0000-0000; Dese: Adeption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doci#; 242292v9




—————— height-of-12-feet-from-natural- grade-to-the-mean-roof-height.“The-site-of-the--—

104.10.1 Flood Hazard Areas. Flood hazard areas relating to all new construction of
buildings, structures and portions of buildings and structures, including substantial
improvement and restoration of substantial damage to buildings and structures shall be I
enforced and regulated jointly by Yavapai County Flood Control District and the Town of
Dewey-Humboldt

Section 105 Permits

Sub-subsection 105.1.1 Annual Permit is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Sub-subsection 105.1.2 Annual Permit Records is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Subsection 105.2 Work Exempt from Permit is hereby deleted in its entirety and amended to
read as follows:

105.2 Work Exempt from Permit. A permit shall not be required for the types of work
in each of the separate classes of permits as listed below. Exemption from the permit
requirements of this code shall not be deemed to grant authorization for any work to be
done in violation of the provisions of the technical codes or any other laws or ordinances
of this jurisdiction.

NOTE: Work exempt from a permit pursuant to this section shall apply ONLY to Building
Safety. Other Town Departments may have permit requirements for these exemptions.

105.2.1 Building Permits. A building permit shall not be required for the following:

1. One-story detached accessory buildings on restdential properties used as tool and
storage sheds, garages, carports, playhouses, animal shades, barns, and similar uses,
provided the area does not exceed 400 square feet under roof and not to exceed a

accessory building must meet all setbacks. Any plumbing, mechanical, and
electrical to structure will require a separate building permit. Detached accessory
buildings shall not be considered or used as habitable space. A separate building
permit is required for any plumbing, electrical or mechanical systems in all
detached buildings.

2. Tree standing Masonry or Concrete walls not over four feet (4”) high (measured
from natural grade) on residential properties used as garden/privacy wall.

Fences not over six feet (67) high, not including masonry or concrete walls.

Oil derricks.

Movable cases, counters and partitions not over five feet nine inches (5°9”) high.
Retaining walls, which are not over four feet (4’) in height, measured from the
bottom of the footing to the top of the wall. All retaining walls which support a

IS

10

File; 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tesh Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v9



surcharge or fill exceeding a maximum of 2 to 1 slope or impounding flammable
liquids will require a building permit.

7. Water tanks supported directly upon grade if the capacity does not exceed 5,000
gallons and the ratio of height to diameter or width does not exceed 2:1.

8. Uncovered decks, platforms, walks and driveways, that are not more than 30 inches
above grade at any point, and do not serve the exit door required by Section R311.4
of the International Residential Code.

9. Remodels (non-structural and no increase in square footage or plumbing, electrical,
and mechanical) on residential properties. This includes painting, papering, tiling,
carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and similar finish wotk.

10. Temporary motion picture, television and theater stage sets and scenery where the
public is not to attend.

11. Window awnings supported by an exterior wall of Group R, Division 3, and Group
U Occupancies which do not project more than fifty-four inches (54”) from the
exterior wall and do not require additional support.

12. Portable swimming pools or portable vessels as noted by the definition for aquatic
vessels in the 2012 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code, being less than 18
inches in water depth which are drained and filled daily and NOT connected to a
circulation system when used as an accessory on single family residential property.

13. Membrane structures constructed for nursery or agricultural purposes and not
including service systems on residential properties not to exceed 400 square feet.

14. Swings and other playground equipment accessory to detached one- and two-family
dwellings.

15. Re-roofing (like for like no sheathing replacement) on residential properties.

16. Concrete flat work (driveways, walkways and pads) not be used in connection with
a structural component on residential properties.

17, New-doors-and-windows (replacement-if-same size;-type-and-function): = oot oo

18. Remodels (non-structural and no increase in square footage or plumbing, electrical,
and mechanical, on residential properties).

19. Flag Poles: (a) ground mounted on residential properties and (b) that its reclining
length, in case of collapse, would be contained within the bounds thereof or (¢} a
height of 20 feet whichever is less. Completing an application for a Zoning
Clearance is waived unless the subject residential property I within a FEMA
delincated floor arca. Any electrical to the pole for lighting and the like will require

a separate electrical permit.
20. Decks, the walking surface of which is not more than 30 inches above the
surrounding grade and less than 120 sq. ft. of surface area.

105.2.2 Plumbing Permits. A plumbing permit shall not be required for the following:

11

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Teeh Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v9




. The stopping of leaks in drains, soil, waste or vent pipe, provided, however; that

should any concealed trap, drain pipe, soil, waste or vent pipe become defective
and it becomes necessary to remove and replace the same with new material, the
same shall be considered as new work and a permit shall be procured and inspection
made as provided in this code.

The clearing of stoppages or the repairing of leaks in pipes, valves or fixtures, nor
for the removal and reinstallation of water closets, provided such repairs do not
involve or require the replacement or rearrangement of valves, pipes or fixtures.

105.2.3 Electrical Permits. An clectrical permit shall not be required for the following:

[—

[ ¥]

9.

_public is not to_attend

. Listed cord-and-plug connected temporary decorative lighting.

Reinstallations of attachment plug receptacles but not the outlets therefor.
Repair or replacement of fixed motors, transformers or fixed approved appliances
of the same type and rating in the same location.

. Replacement of branch circuit overcurrent devices of the required capacity in the

same location.
Electrical wiring, devices, appliances, apparatus or equipment operating at less than
25 volts and not capable of supplying more than 50 watts of energy.

. Minor repair work, including the replacement of lamps or the connection of

approved portable electrical equipment to approved permanently installed
receptacles.

Radio and television transmitting stations; The provisions of this code shall not
apply to electrical equipment used for radio and television transmissions, but do
apply to equipment and wiring for a power supply and the installations of towers
and antennas.

Temporary testing systems: A permit shall not be required for the installation of
any temporary system required for the testing or servicing of electrical equipment
Or apparatus.

The wiring for temporary theater, motion picture or television stage sets where the

10. Low-energy power, controls and mgnal circuit of Class II and Class III as deﬁned

in the Electrical Code.

11. Items as listed per Article 90.2 SCOPE (B) Not Covered in the 2011 National

Electrical Code as adopted by the jurisdiction.

12. Electric water heaters (replacement of the same type and rating).

105.2.4 Mechanical Permits. A mechanical permit shall not be required for the following:

B Wy

A-portable-heating-appliance:

Portable ventilation appliances and equipment.

a portable cooling unit.

Steam, not water or chilled water piping within any heating or cooling equipment
or appliances regulated by this code.

12

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Dosc: Adeption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v9



5. Thereplacement of any minor part that does not alter the approval of equipment or
an appliance or make such equipment or appliance unsafe.

6. A portable evaporative cooler.

7. Self-contained refrigeration systems that contain 10 pounds (4.5kg) or less of
refrigerant or that are actuated by motors of 1 horsepower (0.75 kW) or less,

8. Portable fuel cell appliances that are not connected to a fixed piping system and not
interconnected to a power grid.

9. Gas water heaters (replacement that does not alter existing flue and/or gas
connections or make such equipment unsafe).

105.2.5 Fuel Gas Permits. A fuel gas permit shall not be required for the following:
1. Any portable heating appliance.

2. Replacement of any minor part of equipment that does not alter approval of such
equipment or make such equipment unsafe.

Sub-subection 105.3.2 Time Limitation of Application is deleted in its entirety and revised to
read as follows:

105.3.2 Time Limitation of Application. An application for a permit for any proposed
work shall be deemed to have been abandoned 180 days after the date of filing and such
application shall be expired. The building official is authorized to grant one (1) extension
of time of up to 180 additional days. The extension shall be requested in writing and
justifiable cause demonstrated.

Subsection 105.5 Expiration is deleted in its entirety and revised to read as follows:

105.5 Expiration. Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work authorized

by such permit has commenced within 180 days after its issuvance and a valid inspection

or subsequent valid inspection as detailed by Section 110 is obtained every 180 days
thereafter. The building official is authorized to grant one (1) extension of time for a
petiod of not more than 180 days. All requests for extensions shall be in writing prior to
permit expiration and with justifiable cause demonstrated. Every permit issued shall
become invalid within three and a half (3 1/2) years from the issued date including all
extensions of time. An expired permit shall only be renewed once provided no changes
have been made or will be made in the original issued construction documents and the
renewal application is.submitted within one (1).year of the expiration date.

Subsection 105.7 Placement of Permit is amended by insertion of a new sentence at the end of
this section to read as follows:

105.7 Placement of Permit. The issued premise identification placard (orange card) shall
be conspicuously posted on site and be maintained until the completion of the project.
13

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Dese; Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#; 242292v%




Subsection 105.8 Responsibility is added as a new section to read as follows:

105.8 Responsibility, Tt shall be the duty of every person who performs work for the
installation or repair of building, structure, electrical, fuel gas, mechanical or plumbing
systems for which this code is applicable, to comply with this code.

Subsection 107 Submittal Documents

Subsection 107.1 General is amended by deleting the first paragraph in its entirety and replacing
it to read as follows:

107.1 General. Submittal documents consisting of construction documents, plans,
specifications, engineering calculations, diagrams, geotechnical soil reports, statements of
special inspections, and other data shall be submitted in two (2) or more sets with each
permit application. The construction documents for all disciplines shall be prepared by
an Arizona licensed registrant when the building is regulated by the rules and regulations
of the Arizona State Board of Technical Registration to require sealed plans by a
qualified licensed registrant. The building official may require the applicant submitting
construction documents to demonstrate that state law does not require that the documents
be prepared by an Arizona licensed registrant. Where special conditions exist, the
building official is authorized to require construction documents to be prepared by an
Arizona licensed registrant.

Sub-subsection 107.2.1 Information on Construction Documents is deleted in its entirety and
revised to read as follows:

107.2.1 Information on Construction Documents. Construction documents shall be
dimensioned and drawn upon suitable material. Electronic media documents are

permitted to be submitted when prior approval is obtained from the building official. .. .. . .

Construction documents shall be of sufficient clarity to indicate the location, nature and
extent of the work proposed and show in detail that it will conform to the provisions of
this code and relevant laws, ordinances, rules and regulations, as determined by the
building official. All braced wall lines, shall be identified on the construction documents
and all pertinent information including, but not limited to, bracing methods, location and
length of braced wall panels, attachment of braced wall panels to foundation and at top of
braced wall lines shall be provided.

Sub-subsection 107.2.2 Fire Protection System Shop Drawings is deleted in its entirety and
revised to read as follows:

107.2.2 Fire Protection Shop Drawings. Shop drawings for the fire protection
system(s) shall be submitted to the Authority Having Jurisdiction (AHJ) as determined by

14

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doct: 2422929



the Central Yavapai Fire District for review and shall be approved by the AHJ prior to the
start of system installation. The building official shall receive official notification of such
approval prior to continued inspections of work in areas where fire protection system(s)
are required.

Sub-subsection 107.2.5 Site Plan is deleted in its entirety and revised to read as follows:

107.2.5 Site Plan. The construction documents submitted with the application for a
permit shall be accompanied by a site plan drawn to a defined scale showing the size and
locations of all new construction and existing structures on the site, distances from all lot
lines, the existing (native) and proposed final grade contour intervals, building pad
elevations, finished floor elevations, drainage flow directions, utility line locations
(water, gas, sewer, septic, and ¢lectrical) and cut and fill amounts of any grading. In the
case of demolition, the 8 ¥4 x 117 plot plan shall show structure(s) to be demolished and
the location and size of existing structure(s) to remain on the property. The building
official is authorized to waive or modify the requirement for a site plan when the
application for permit is for alteration or repair or when otherwise warranted.

Sub-sub-subsection 107.2.5.2 Manufacturer’s Installation Imstructions is added as a new
gection to read as follows:

107.2.5.2 Manufacturer’s Installation Imstructions, Manufacturer’s Installation
Instructions, as required by this code, shall be available on the job site at the time of
inspection.

Sub-subsection 107.3.3 Phased Approval is deleted in its entirety.

Sub-subsection 107.3.4.1 Deferred Submittals is amended by addition of a new first paragraph
. to read as follows: . .

107.3.4.1 Deferred Submittals. Deferred submittals of this code shall apply to all
buildings, EXCEPT detached one- and two-family dwellings and their accessory
structures as defined under the provisions of the International Residential Code as
adopted by this jurisdiction. Deferred items will require submittal of construction
document sets as set forth in sections 107.1 and 107.2 and to be examined and approved
by the building official as set forth in sections 107.3 and 107.3.1 prior to any work
described in such deferred submittals being commenced.

Section 108 Temporary Structures and Use
Subsection 108.1 General is amended to read:

108.1 General. The building official is authorized on behalf of the Community

15

File:; 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v9




Development Director or Zoning Administrator, to issue a permit for temporary housing
while constructing a permanent dwelling pursuant to Town Code Section
153.036(B)(8). In addition, the building official is authorized to issue a permit for
temporary structures and temporary uses such as on-site construction office trailers or
storage units (not intended to serve as living quarters). Such permits shall be limited as
to time of service subject to a valid building permit for a principal structure but shall not
be permitted for more than 180 days. In such cases, the building official is authorized to
grant extensions for demonstrated cause.

Subsection 108.3 Temporary Power is amended by addition of the 2011 National Electrical
Code to the end of the last sentence.

Section 109 Fees is deleted in its entirety and revised to read as follows:
Section 109 Fees

109.1 Payment of Fees. Fees shall be assessed in accordance with the provisions of this
section or shall be as set forth in the fee schedule adopted by this jurisdiction.

109.2 Schedule of Permit Fees: Valuations shalt be assigned and fees shall be assessed in
accordance with the current valuation and fee schedule recommended and approved by the
Town of Dewey-Humboldt.

109.3 Plan Review Fees. When submittal documents are required by Section 107, a
deposit shall be paid at the time documents are submitted for plan review. Said deposit
shall be as shown in the Valuation and Fee Schedule adopted by the Town of Dewey-
Humboldt Town Council.

The plan review fees for electrical, mechanical and plumbing work shall be as shown in

the Valuation and Fee Schedule adopted by the Town of Dewey-Humboldt Town
Council.

The plan review fee for grading work shall be as shown in the Valuation and Fee Schedule
adopted by the Town of Dewey-Humboldt Town Council. The plan review fees specified
in this section are separate fees from the permit fees specified in Section 109.2 and are in
addition to the permit fees.

When submittal documents-are-incomplete-orchanged so-as to_require.additional plan

review or when the project involves deferred submittal items as defined in Section
107.3.4.1, an additional plan review fee shall be charged at the rate shown in the
Valuation and Fee Schedule adopted by the Town of Dewey-Humboldt Town Council.

109.4 Work Commencing Before Permit Issuance. Any person who commences any

work on a building, structure, electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing system before
16

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adeption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v9




obtaining the necessary permits shall be subject to a fee equal to the amount of the permit
fee required by this code and shall be in addition to the required permit fees.

109.5 Investigation. Whenever work for which a permit is required by this code has
been commenced without first obtaining a permit, a special investigation may be made
prior to a permit being issued for such work.

Exception: Repairs performed in an emergency situation where the application
was submitted the next business day.

109.5.1 Investigation Permit Fee, An investigation fee, in addition to the permit
fee, shall be collected whether or not & permit is then or subsequently issued. The
investigation fee shall be equal to the amount of the permit fee required by this
code. The minimum investigation fee shall be the same as the minimum fee set
forth in the Valuation and Fee Schedule adopted by the Town of Dewey-
Humboldt Town Council. The payment of such investigation fee shall not exempt
an applicant from compliance with all other provisions of either this code; the
technical codes, and from the penalty prescribed by law.

109.6 Related Fees. The payment of the fee for the construction, alteration, removal or
demolition for work done in connection to or concurrently with the work authorized by a
building permit shall not relieve the applicant or holder of the permit from the payment of
other fees that are prescribed by law and the Town of Dewey-Humboldt Code of
Ordinances.

109.7 Fee Refunds

The building official may authorize refunding of a fee paid hereunder, which was
erroneously paid or collected.

The building official may authorize refunding the greater of $25.00 or 25% of the

issued in accordance with this code.

The building official may authorize refunding the greater of $10.00 or 25% of plumbing,
electrical, and mechanical fees paid when no work and no inspections have been done
under a permit issued in accordance with this code.

The building official may authorize refunding a plan review fee for a permit withdrawn
after a deposit fee has been paid at the greater of the per-hour charge rate (minimum of
one-hour)-or-the-calculated plan-review-fee—No-refund-of planreview fees-shall-be-made

building permit fée paid whén no work and no inspections have been done undéra perinit

once plan review on a plan has begun.

The building official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid except upon written
application filed by the original applicant no later than 180 days after the date of fee
payment,

17

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#t: 242292v9



Section 110 Inspections is deleted in its entirety and revised to read as follows:
Section 110 Inspections

110.1 General. Construction or work for which a permit is required shall be subject to
inspection by the building official and such construction or work shall remain accessible
and exposed for inspection purposes until approved. Approval as a result of an
inspection shall not be construed to be an approval of a violation of the provisions of this
code or of other ordinances of the jurisdiction. Inspections presuming to give authority to
violate or cancel the provisions of this code or of other ordinances of the jurisdiction shall
not be valid. It shall be the duty of the permit applicant to cause the work to remain
accessible and exposed for inspection purposes, Neither the building official nor the
jurisdiction shall be liable for expense entailed in the removal or replacement of any
material required to allow inspection.

A survey of the property, as done by an Arizona licensed surveyor may be required by
the building official to verify that buildings, structures and related features are located in
accordance with the approved plans.

110.2 Prelimtinary Inspection. Before issuing a permit, the building official is
authorized to examine, or cause to be examined, the buildings, structures and sites for
which an application has been filed.

110.3 Required Inspections. The building official, upon notification, shall make the
inspections set forth in Sections 110.3.1 through 110.3.15.

110.3.1 Footing. Footing inspection shall be made after excavations for footings
are complete and any required reinforcing steel is in place. For concrete footings,
any required forms shall be in place prior to inspection. As required by ACI
standards, all vertical steel shall be tied in place at the time of footing inspection.

110.3.2 Stem Wall/Grout. Stem wall inspections of masonry or formed concrete

walls; shall-be-made priorto-any grout or concrete being-placed-afier the masonry -

units and required forms are completed and any required reinforcing steel
installed, including the installation of any required framing attachments, which
shall be secured to the un-grouted masonry units or concrete wall forms.

110.3.3 Reinforced Masonry, Insulating Conerete Form (ICF) and
Conventionally Formed Concrete Wall. Reinforced masonry walls, insulating
concrete form (ICF) walls and conventionally formed concrete walls shall be
inspected after plumbing, mechanical and electrical systems embedded within the

walls;-and-reinforeing-steel-are-in-place-and-prior-to-placement-of-grout-or

concrete. Inspection shall verify the correct size, location, spacing and lapping of
reinforcing. For masonry walls, inspection shall also verity that the location of
grout cleanouts and size of grout spaces comply with the requirements of this
code.

110.3.4 Concrete Slab and Under-floor. Concrete slab and under-floor
18

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doef: 2422929




inspections shall be made after in-slab or under-floor reinforcing steel and
building service equipment, conduit, piping accessories and other ancillary
equipment items are in place, but before any concrete is placed or floor sheathing
installed, including the sub floor. Residential building concrete slab inspections
shall include the garage floor.

110.3.5 Floodplain. For construction in areas prone to flooding, as determined
by the Yavapai County Flood Control District, upon placement of the lowest
floor, including the basement, and prior to further vertical construction, the
building official shall require submission of documentation, prepared and scaled
by a registered design professional, of the elevation of the lowest floor, including
the bagsement,

110.3.6 Plumbing, Mechanical, Gas and Electrical Systems. Rough inspection
of plumbing, mechanical, gas and electrical systems shall be made prior to
covering or concealment, before fixtures or appliances are set or installed, and
prior to slab grade inspection, or at the time of rough-in inspection prior to
insulation.,

Exception: Back-filling of ground-source heat pump loop systems tested
in accordance with Sections M2105.1 of the 2012 International Residential
Code and 1208.1.1 of the 2012 International Mechanical Code prior to
inspection shall be permitted.

110.3.7 Roof Nailing and Fxterior Braced Wall Panels. Roof nailing and
exterior braced wall panel inspection shall be made after the roof deck sheathing,
exterior wall sheathing, and required wall framing attachments are in place and
prior to the installation of the roofing material and exterior wall covering. All
required wall framing attachments to the foundation and stem wall systems shall
be in place.

110.3.8 Framing and Exterior Lath. Framing inspection shall be made afier all

framing, fire-blocking, windows, and bracing are in place and pipes, chimneys
and vents to be concealed are complete and the rough electrical, plumbing,
heating, wiring, pipes and ducts are installed. All penetrations through the floor
and through the top plate into the attic must be sealed and exterior lath is installed
and roof completely dried in with either the roofing material or approved roofing
paper. The exterior lath inspection, for stucco wall covering, shall be made at this
time.

110.3.9 Water-Resistive and/or Air Barrier. A water-resistive barrier and/or air

barrier inspection shall be performed after all flashings, windows and barriers are
installed prior to the installation of any exterior wall covering.

19

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Docs#: 242292v0




110.3.10 Insulation. Insulation inspection shall be made after frame and exterior
lath inspection and all rough plumbing, mechanical, gas, and electrical systems
are approved and prior to covering or concealment. Blown or sprayed
roof/ceiling insulation may be verified before final inspection with markers
affixed to the trusses or joists and marked with the insulation thickness by one
inch (1) high numbers. A minimum of one (1) marker provided for each 300
square feet of area with numbers to face the attic access opening.

110.3.11 Gypsum Board. An inspection shall be made of the gypsum board,
interior and exterior, before any joints and fasteners are taped and finished.

110.3.12 Fire-resistant Penetrations and Fire-Resistance-Rated Construction.
Protection of joints and penetrations in fire-resistance-rated assemblies shall not
be concealed from view until inspected and approved. Where fire-resistance-
rated construction is required between dwelling units or due to location on
propetty, the building official shall require an inspection of such construction
after all lathing and/or wallboard is in place, but before any plaster is applied, or
before wall board joints and fasteners are taped and finished.

110.3.13 Special Inspections. For special inspections, see Section 1704 of the
2012 International Building Code.

110.3.14 Other Inspections. In addition to the inspections specified above the
building official is authorized to make or require other inspections of any
construction work to ascertain compliance with the provisions of this code and -
other laws that are enforced by Building Safety.

110.3.15 Final. Final inspection shall be made after the permitted work is
completed and prior to occupancy.

110.4 Inspection Agencies. The building official is authorized to accept reports of
approved inspection agencies, _p_rovided such agencies satisfy the requirements as to

qualifications and reliability.

110.5 Inspection Requests. Tt shall be the duty of the holder of the building permit or
their duly authorized agent to notify the building official when work is ready for
inspection. It shall be the duty of the permit holder to provide access to and means for
inspections of such work that are required by this code.

110.6 Approval Required. Work shall not be done beyond the point indicated in each
successive inspection without first obtaining the approval of the building official. The

indicate the portion of the construction that is satisfactory as completed, or notify the
permit holder or his or her agent wherein the same fails to comply with this code. Any
portions that do not comply shall be corrected and such portion shall not be covered or
concealed until authorized by the building official.

110.7 Re-inspection.
20

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v9




110.7.1 A re-inspection fee may be assessed for each inspection or re-inspection
when:

1. such portion of work for which inspection is called is not complete or when
corrections called for are not made;

2. When the inspection record card is not posted or otherwise available on the

work site;

When the approved plans are not readily available to the inspector;

For failure to provide access on the date for which inspection is requested;

For deviating from approved plans thereby requiring the approval of the

building official.

koW

110.7.2 This section is not to be interpreted as requiring re-inspection fees the
first time a job is rejected for failure to comply with the requirements of the technical
codes, but as controlling the practice of calling for inspections before the job is ready for
such inspection or re-inspection.

110.7.3 To obtain a re-inspection, the applicant shall pay the re-inspection fee as
set forth in the fee schedule adopted by this jurisdiction.

110.7.4 In instances where re-inspection fees have been assessed, additional
inspection of the work will not be performed until the required fees have been paid.

Section 111 Certificate of Occupancy

Subsection 111.1 Certificate Issued is Eimended by addition of an “Exception” to read as
foliows:

111.1 Certificate Issued.

Exception: Certificates of occupancies are not required for work exempt from
permits under Section 105.2 of this code on residential remodels, additions, and
accessory buildings.or. structures on residential properties being used for non- . ..

habitable residential purposes, Certificates of Completion shall be issued on
permits issued as a Shell Building. Certificates of completion shall not authorize
occupancy.

Section 113 Board of Appeals, Subsection 113,1 General is amended to read as follows:

113.1 General. In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions, or
determinations made by the building official relative to the application and interpretation
of this code, there shall be and is hereby created a board of appeals. the board of appeals

shall be appointed by the Town Council and shall hold office at its pleasure. The board
shall adopt rules of procedure for conducting business. The Town Council may appoint,
as the Town’s board of appeals, a board duly appointed by another municipality or
County.

SECTION 114 Violations is deleted in its entirety and revised to read as follows:
21

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Docif: 242282v9




SECTION 114 Violations shall be handled through §§ 153,019, 153.020, and 153,999 of
the Zoning Regulations unless otherwise provided.

114.1 Violations. It shall be unlawful for any person, firm or corporation to erect,
construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move, improve, remove, convert or demolish, equip, use,
occupy or maintain any building, structure or building service equipment regulated by
this code, or cause or permit the same to be done in conflict with or violation of any
provision of this code or any technical code adopted by the Town.

114.2 Notice of violation. The Building Official or Code Official is authorized to serve a
notice of violation or order on the person responsible for the erection, construction,
alteration, extension, repair, moving, removal, demolition, or occupancy of a building or
structure in violation of the provisions of this code or in violation of a permit or
certificate issued pursuant to this code. Such order shall direct the discontinuance of the
illegal action or condition and the abatement of the violation. The notice shall be served
either by personal service or by certified mail sent to the last known address of the owner,
the owner's authorized agent or the owner's statutory agent and to the address to which
the tax bill for the property was last mailed. The Code Official may record the notice in
the Yavapai County Recorder's Office; but if the notice is recorded and compliance with
the notice is subsequently satisfied, the Code Official shall record a release of the notice.

114.3 Prosecution of Vielation. If the notice of violation is not complied with within
ten {10) working days of service, or sooner if determined to be a matter of imminent
danger of physical harm to persons living or working in the vicinity, the Building Official
or Code Official is authorized to institute the appropriate action at law or in equity to
restrain, correct or abate such violation or to require the removal or termination of the
unlawful occupancy of the building or structure in violation of the provisions of this code
or of the order or direction made pursuant thereto.

114.4 Penalties. Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails to comply
with any of the requirements thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a building

or structure in violation-of the-approved construction. document or directive-of the - -
building official or of a permit or certificate issued pursuant to this code shall be subject
to penalties as prescribed by law for violations of municipal codes.

114.5 Continuing Violation; Habitual Offender.

114.5.1 Fach day a violation of this code continues shall be deemed a separate
offense,

114.5.2 After having been found responsible for committing three or more civil

infractions of the same code provision in any twenty-four-month period, whether
by admission, by payment of the fine, by default or by judgment after hearing, a
person is a habitual offender and may be charged with a Class I misdemeanor.
For purposes of calculating the twenty-four-month period under this subsection,
the dates of the commission of the offenses shall be used. Any person found
guilty of a Class 1 misdemeanor under this subsection shall be punished by a fine

22

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doctf; 242292v9




of not less than five hundred dollars nor more than twenty-five hundred dollars,
exclusive of penalty assessments prescribed by law or by imprisonment for a
period not to exceed six months, or by both such fine and imprisonment, Each day
that a violation continues shall be a separate offense punishable as hereinabove
described.

II. The Town of Dewey-Humboldt, Arizona Code of Ordinances, Title XV Land
Usage, Chapter 150 Building Codes, Subchapter Codes Adopted, § 150.02 Building Code, as

Amended is hereby repealed in its entirety and new § 150.02 Building Code is adopted to read as
follows:

§ 150.02 Building Code.

(A) Adoption of International Building Code. That certain document entitled “International
Building Code, 2012 Edition,” together with Appendices C and I, published by the International
Code Council, is hereby adopted as the Building Code of the Town of Dewey-Humboldt, for
regulating the erection, construction, enlargement, alteration, repair, moving, demolition,
conversion, occupancy, use height, area and maintenance of all buildings and structures in the
Town, and made a part of this chapter as though fully set forth herein, except as the same is
amended herein.

(B) Amendments.
Chapter 3 Use and Occupancy Classification Section 305

Educational Group E

Section 305.2 Group E day care facilitics is amended by adding the following:

_ Exception: Child day care facilities complying with the requirements of ARS § 36-897

et seq. and providing child care for less than 24 hours per day for not less than five (5)
children but no more than ten (10) children through the age of twelve years shall be
classified as Group R-3, provided that all child care rooms are located on the level of exit
discharge and each child care room has an exit door directly to the outside.

Section 308 Institutional Group

Subsection 308.3 Institutional Group I-1, is amended to read as follows:

Section 308.3 Institutional Group I-1: This occupancy shall include buildings,
structures or portions thereof housing more than 10 persons who, because of age, mental
disability or other reasons, reside on a 24-hour basis in a residential environment that
provides supervisory care services. The occupants are capable of responding to an
emergency situation without physical assistance from staff, This group shall include, but
is not limited to the following;

23

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v9



Alcohol and Drug Centers

Assisted Living Facilities

Congregate Care Facilities

Convalescent Facilities

Group Homes

Halfway Houses

Residential Board and Custodial Care Facilities
Social Rehabilitation Facilities

Section 308.3.1 Five or fewer persons receiving care.

A facility such as the above with five or fewer persons receiving such care shall
be classified as a Group R-3 or shall comply with the International Residential
Code, Section101.2.

Section 308.3.2 Six to Ten Persons Receiving Care. A facility such as above,
housing at least six and not more than ten persons receiving such care, shall be
classified as Group R-4.

Subsection 308.4 Institutional Group I-2, is hereby amended to read as follows:
Section 308.4 Institutional 1-2

This occupancy shall include buildings, and structures used for medical, surgical,
psychiatric, nursing, custodial, personal, or directed care on a 24- hour basis for more
than a five persons who are not capable of self-preservation by responding to an
emergency situation without physical assistance from staff. This group shall include, but
not be limited to, the following:

Foster care facilities Detoxification facilities Hospitals
Psychiatric hospitals .

This occupancy shall also include buildings and structures used for assisted living homes
providing supervisory, personal, or directed care on a 24-hour basis for more than 10
persons who are not capable of self-preservation by responding to an emergency situation
without physical assistance from staff, A facility such as the above with 10 or fewer
persons receiving such care shall be classified as a R-4 Condition 2.

Section 308.4.1 Five or fewer persons receiving care. A facility such as the

above-with-five-orfewerpersons-shall-be-classified-as-Group-R-3-or-shall-comply.

with Section 101.2 of the International Residential Code.

Section 308.6 Institutional Group I-4 Day Care Facilities is amended to include the
following:

Exception: A child day care facility complying with the requirements of ARS §§ 36-897
24

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doclf: 242292v9



et seq. and providing child care for less than 24 hours per day for not less than five
children but no more than ten children through the age of twelve years shall be classified
as Group R-3, provided that all child care rooms are located on the level of exit
discharge and each child care room has and exit door directly to the exterior.

Subsection 308.6 Institutional Group I-4, day care facilities, Subsection 308 6.2 Within a
place of religious worship, is hereby deleted in its entirety

Section 310 RESIDENTIAL GROUP R: Subsection 310.2 Definitions is amended by adding
the following definitions to read as follows:

DIRECTED CARE SERVICES: Care of residents, including personal care services,
who are incapable of recognizing danger, summoning assistance, expressing need, or
making basic care decisions.

PERSONAL CARE SERVICE: Assistance with activities of daily living that can be
petformed by persons without professional skills or professional training and includes the
coordination or provisions of intermittent nursing services and the administration of
medications and treatments.

RESIDENTIAL CARE/ASSISTED LIVING HOME: A building or part thereof
housing a maximum of 10 persons, excluding staff, on a 24-hour basis, who because of
age, mental disability or other reasons, live in a supervised residential environment which
provides supervisory, personal, or directed services. This classification shall include, but
not be limited to the following: residential board and care facilities, assisted living
homes, halfway houses, group homes, congregate care facilities, social rehabilitation
facilities, alcohol and drug abuse centers, and convalescent facilities.

SUPERVISORY CARE SERVICE: General supervision, including daily awareness of
resident functioning and continuing needs.

Section 310.5 Residential Group R-3 is amended to read as follows:

Section 310.5 Residential Group R-3. Residential occupancies where the occupants are
primarily permanent in nature and not classified as Group R-1, R-2, R-4, or 1, as follows:

Buildings that do not contain more than two dwellings units as applicable in Section

1.201 of the International Residential Code, _

Adult and child care facilities that provide accommuodations for five or fewer persons of
any age.

Adult and child care facilities that are within a single-family home are permitted to
comply with the International Residential Code in accordance with Section 101.2 of this
code.

25

File; 1908-003-0000-0000; Dese: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v%




Section 310 Residential Group R: Subsection 310.6 Residential Group R-4, is amended to
read as follows:

Section 310.6 Residential Group R-4. This occupancy shall include buildings or
structures, or portions thereof, which are used for residential occupancies and not
classified as Group R-1, R-2, R-3 or Institutional Group I. Residential occupancies shall
include the following:

Buildings arranged for occupancy as residential care/assisted living facilities
Including more than five but not more than ten occupants, excluding staff.

CONDITION 1: This occupancy condition shall include facilities licensed to provide
supervisory care services, in which occupants are capable of self-preservation by
responding to an emergency situation without physical assistance from staff. Condition 1
facilities housing more than 10 persons shall be classified as a Group I-1.

CONDITION 2: This occupancy condition shall include facilities licensed to provide
personal or directed care services, in which occupants are incapable of self-preservation
by responding to an emergency without physical assistance from staff. Condition 2
facilities housing more than 10 persons shall be classified a Group I-2.

Chapter 4 Special Detailed Requirements Based on Use and Occupancy

Section 420 Groups I-1, R-1, R-2, and R-3 is renamed and amended in its entirety to read as
follows:

Section 420 Group R-4 Occupancies

Section 420.1 Applicability. The provisions of this section shall apply to Group R-4

occupaneies-consirueted-and-operated-within-the Town—

Section 420.2 Construction Requirements. Group R-4 occupancies shall meet the
requirements for construction as defined in Group R-3 except as otherwise provided for
in this code, or shall comply with Section 419 of this code and the International
Residential Code.

Section 420.2.1 Construction Materials. Group R-4 occupancies may be
constructed of any materials allowed by this code.

Section 420.2.2 Height, Size and Location. Group R-4 occupancies shall be
separated from other uses as provided in Table 508.3.3 of this code, shall not
exceed two stories in height or be located above the second story in any building,
and any second story shall not exceed 2000 square feet, except as provided in
Section 506 of the International Building Code. Mixed Group R-4 occupancies

26

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v9




shall be separated from other uses as provided in Table 302.3.2 of this code.

Section 420.2.3 Fire resistant construction. Group R-4 occupancies having
more than

2000 square feet of floor area above the first floor shall not be less than one hour,
fire resistant construction throughout.

Section 420.2.4 Accessibility. Group R-4 occupancies shall include at least one
entrance that meets the requirements of the Arizonans with disabilities Act
(ARS§§ 9-499.02 and 41-1492 through 41-1492.11). Sleeping rooms and
associated toilets shall be accessible by residents in compliance with the
requirements set forth in Section 3409 of this code. Bathing and toilet facilities in
existing buildings shall be fitted with grab bars in accordance with ICC/ANSI -A
117.1.

Exception: Existing buildings shall comply with the accessibility

Section 420.2.5 Exits. Every story, basement, or portion of a Group R-4
occupancy shall have at least two exits.

Exception: Group R-4 occupancies with a second story which does not
contain sleeping rooms may have one exit on the second story as provided
in Chapter 10.

Section 420.2.6 Distance to Exits, The maximum travel distance to an exit shall
comply with the requirements of Section 1004 of this code.

Exception: The maximum travel distance from the center point of any
sleeping room to an exit shall not exceed 75 feet.

Section-420.2.7 Emergency Exit Mumination: In the event of a power-failure;:
exits shall be automatically illuminated by an emergency system powered by
storage batteries or an onsite generator installed in accordance with the National
Electrical Code.

Section 420.2.8 Emergency Escape and Rescue. Group R-4 occupancies shall
comply with the requirement of Section 1025 of this code.

Exception: Section 1025.1 of this code shall not apply to Group R-4

occupancies:

Section 420.2.9 Delayed Egress Locks. In group R-4 condition 2 occupancies,
delayed egress locks shall be permitted in accordance with Sections 1008.1.9.7
and 1008.1.8.6, items 1,2,4,5 and 6 of this code.

Section 420.2.10 Smoke Alarms, All habitable rooms and hallways in Group R-4
27

File; 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doci#f: 242292v9



occupancies shall be equipped with smoke alarms installed in accordance with
Section 907.2.10.1-3 of this code.

Section 420.2.11 Sprinkler Systems, Group R-4 occupancies shall be equipped
with a sprinkler system installed throughout, including attached garages, in
accordance with Section 903.2.9 of this code, In Group R-4 Condition 2
occupancics, sprinkler systems shall also be installed in attics and concealed
spaces consisting of or containing combustible materials. Such concealed spaces
consisting of or containing combustible material, such systems shall not contain
unsupervised valves between the domestic water riser control valve and the
sprinklers. In Group R-4 Condition 2 occupancies, such systems shall contain
water-flow switches electrically supervised by an approved supervising station
and shall sound an audible signal at the location staffed 24 hours per day, 7 days a
week.

Chapter 9 Fire Protection Systems
Section 901 General, is deleted in its entirety and amended to read as follows:

Section 901 General. Fire protection systems shall be installed, repaired, operated, maintained
and enforced in accordance with the requirements of the Central Yavapai Fire District (the “Fire
District”) and the International Fire Code, as adopted and amended from time to time by the Fire
District ( the “Fire District Requirements”). The Building Official shall assist the Fire District in
the inspection, testing and oversight of fire protection systems as may be required. The Building
Official shall withhold approvals where fire protection systems are not in compliance with Fire
District Requirements.

Sections 902 through 915 are deleted in their entirety.

Chapter 11 Accessibility Section 1101 — General

Section 1101.2 “Design” is hereby amended to read as follows:
Section 1101.2 Design, Accessibility requirements shall be the most restricted of those
stated in the 2010 Standards for Accessible Design or Chapter 11 Accessibility of the
International Building Code, 2012 Edition.

Chapter 12 Interior Environment

Section 1207 Sound Trainsmission 1§ deleted o its entirety

Chapter 15 Roof Assemblies and Rooftop Structures, Section 1507.3 is amended to read as
follows:

Section 1507.3 Clay and concrete tile. The installation of clay and concrete tile shall
28

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v9



comply with the provisions of this section.

Section 1507.3.1 Concrete and clay tile shall be installed only over solid
sheathing.

Section 1507.4 Metal Roof Panels is amended to read as follows:

Section 1507.4 Metal Roof Panels. The installation of metal roof panels shall comply
with this section.

Section 1507.4.1 Metal roof shingles shall be applied to a solid sheathed roof
deck.

Section 1507.8 Wood shingles is amended to read as follows:

1507.8 Wood Shingles. The installation of wood shingles shall comply with the
provisions of this section and Table 1507.8 and shall be installed on solid sheathing.

Table 1507.8 Wood Shingle and Shake Installation is amended to delete “or spaced sheathing”
and associated installation requirements from *“2. Deck Requirement”.

Section 1507.9 Wood Shakes is amended to read as follows:

Section 1507.9 Wood shakes. The installation of wood shakes shall comply with this
section and Table 1507.8 as amended.

Section 1507.9.1 Wood shakes shall only be used on solid sheathing.

Chapter 16 Structural Design

Section 1607.1 General, Table 1607.1 Minimum Uniformly Distributed Live Loads and
Minimum Concentrated Live Loads #25 is amended to read as follows:

Occupancy or Use Uniform Concentrated
paney (psf) (Ibs)
25. Residential
One- and two-family dwellings
Aok
Uninhabitable Attics with storage
40
Habitable Attics and sleeping areas
40
s o ok

29

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc; Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Dac#: 242292v9



Chapter 18 Soils and Foundations

Section 1809.4 Depth of footings is amended to read:

The minimum depth of footings below the undisturbed ground surface shall be 18” inches.
Section 1809.5 Frost Protection is amended to delete the listed exceptions.

Chapter 34 Existing Structures

Section 3412 Compliance Alternatives is deleted in its entirety.

III.  The Town of Dewey-Humboldt, Arizona Code of Ordinances, Title XV Land
Usage, Chapter 150 Building Codes, Subchapter Codes Adopted, § 150.03 Residential Code for

One- and Two-Family Dwellings, as Amended is hereby repealed in its entirety and new §
150.03 Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings is adopted to read as follows:

§ 150.03 Residential Code for One-and Two-family Dwellings.

(A)  That certain code entitled “International Residential Code for One-and Two-Family
Dwellings, 2012 Edition”, together with appendices A, B, C, H, J and Q thereto, published by
the International Code Council, is hereby adopted as the Residential Code for One- and Two-
Family Dwellings of the Town of Dewey-Humboldt for regulating erection, construction,
enlargement, alteration, repair, moving, removal, demolition, convetsion, occupancy,
equipment, use, height, area and maintenance of all R-3 occupancies in the town, and made
part of this chapter the same as though said code with named appendices and referenced
standards was specifically set forth in full herein, except as amended below.

(B) Amendments:

The International Residential Code for One-and Two-Family Dwellings shall be amended as
follows:

Chapter 1 Scope and Administration

Section R101.1 Title is amended to read as follows:

These regulations shall be known as the Residential Code for One-and Two-Family
Dwellings of the Town of Dewey-Humboldt, and shall be referred to herein as “this
code.”

Section R102.7 Existing Structures is amended fo read as follows:

30

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v9



The legal occupancy of any structure existing on the date of the adoption of this code
shall be permitted to continue without change, except as is specifically covered in this
code or the International Fire Code as adopted and amended by the Central Yavapai
Fire District, or as is deemed necessary by the building official for the general safety
and welfare of the occupants and the public.

Section R105.3.1.1 Determination of substantially improved or substantially damaged
existing buildings in flood hazard areas is hereby deleted.

Sections R108 Fees, R109 Inspections, R112 Board of Appeals, and R113 Violations are
deleted in their entirety and replaced with the requirements of the Town of Dewey-Humboldt
Administrative Code.

Chapter 2 Definitions
Section R201.4 Terms not defined is amended to read as follows:

Section R201.4 Terms not defined. Where terms are not defined through the
methods authorized by this section, such terms shall have ordinarily accepted meanings
such as the context implies, Webster’s Third New International Dictionary of the
English Language, Unabridged, shall be considered as providing ordinarily accepted
meanings.

Chapter 3 Building Planning

Table R301.2(1) Climatic and Geographical Design Criteria is amended to read as follows:
Roof Snow Load- 30 lbs/per sq ft., Wind — 90 mph - 3 second gust Exposure C:
Seismic Design Category C; Weathering — Negligible; Frost Line Depth- 12” inches;

Termite- Moderate; Decay — Slight; Winter Design Temperature -- PV + 150; Ice
Shield Underlayment Requirement —No; Flood Hazards-— Administered-by the -

Building Official; Air Freczing Index — 124; Mean Annual Temp — 53.
Table R301.5 Live Load is amended by amending Table R301.5 Minimum Uniformly
Distributed Live Loads to require 40 pounds minimum live load in both “Uninhabitable attics

with limited storage” and “Sleeping rooms™.

Section R305 Ceiling Height, R305.1 is amended to read:

Section R305:1 The miitimutn ceiling height-for-any habitable room-shall-be-76™ (seven
feet, six inches).

Section R309.5 Fire Sprinklers is deleted in its entirety.

Section R313 Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems is deleted in its entirety and replaced by the
31

Tile: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#; 242292v%



following;:

Section R313 Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems. Automatic fire sprinkler systems

shall be installed as required by and in compliance with the Arizona Revised Statutes and
the requirements of the International Fire Code as adopted and amended by the Central .
Yavapai Fire District. ‘1

Section R314.3 entitled “Location” is hereby amended by adding a new item 4, to read as
follows:

4. Where the ceiling height of a room open to the hallway servicing bedrooms exceeds ,
that of the hallway by 24 inches or more, smoke detectors shall be installed in the |
hallways and in the adjacent room.

Chapter 4 Foundations

Section 403 Footings, Subsection R403.1 General, Sub-subsection R403.1.1 Minimum Size
is amended by adding an additional paragraph to read:

Continuous spread concrete footings shall be reinforced with at least one #4 horizontal .
reinforcement bar located three inches (3”) from the bottom of the footing. Monolithic :
interior and exterior concrete footings shall be reinforced with at least one #4

horizontal, located three inches (3”) from the bottom of the footing and one #4 located

three inches (3”) from the top of the slab. Pier and column footings shall be reinforced

with #4 horizontal reinforcement spaced no more than twelve inches (127"} in each

direction and located three inches (3”) from the bottom of the footing.

Section R403.1.3.1 Foundations with stem walls is deleted in its entirety and replaced with
the following:

Section R403.1.3.1 Foundations with stemwalls,- Foundations-with stem walls-shallbe-——————
provided with the following steel reinforcement unless an engineered design is provided.

1. F'or non-retaining stem walls less than twenty four inches (24”) in height, a bond
beam composed of one horizontal #4 rebar is required at the top of the wall and
one #4 vertical rebar is provided at forty-eight inches (48”) on center. The vertical
reinforcement shall extend into the footing with a bent hook having a minimum of
six-inch (6”") 90 degree bend.

2. For stem walls twenty-four inches (24”) to forty-eight inches (48”y in heighta
bond beam composed of two horizontal #4 rebar, or one #5 rebar is required at
the top of the wall and one #4 vertical rebar is provided at forty-eight inches
(48 on center. The vertical reinforcement shall extend into the footing with a
bent hook having a minimum of six-inch (6”) 90-degree bend.

32

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 2422929



3. For stem walls over forty-eight inches (48”) in height or retaining two (2) or
more feet of earth, engineering may be required to determine footing size, wall
thickness, materials, steel placement and size (depending on soil conditions),
height, surcharge loading, or other requirements at the option of the building
official (or his designee).

Section R403.1.4 Minimum Depth is amended to read as follows:
Section R403.1.4 All exterior footings shall be placed a minimum of eighteen (18”)
inches into undisturbed or compacted soil.
Sub-subsection R403.1.4.1 Frost Protection is amended to delete exceptions 1, 2, and 3.
Section R404 Foundation and Retaining Walls
Subsection R404.1 Concrete and Masonry Foundation Walls, Sub-subsection R404.1.1

Design of Masonry Foundation Walls, and Sub-subsection R404.1.2 Concrete Foundation
Walls are hereby amended in their entirety to read as follows:

R404.1.1 Design of masonry foundation walls. Concrete masonry foundation walls shall be
constructed as set forth in Tables R404.1.1(2) and R404.1.1(4) of the International Residential
Code for the most restrictive design soil class, provided that the minimuwm vertical
reinforcement is #4 bar spaced no more than 48 inches on center, and shall also comply with
the provisions of this section and the applicable provisions of Section R606, R607 and R608.
In Seismic Design Category D0, D1 and D2, concrete masonry foundation walls shall comply
with Section R404.1.4 of the International Residential Code. Rubble stone masonry walls shall
not be used in Seismic Design Category C, DO, D1, or D2.

R404.1.2 Concrete Foundation Walls, Concrete foundation walls shall be constructed

as-set-forth-in-Tables R404.1:12),R404.1.1-(3);-and R404.1.1- (4)-of the International

Residential Code for the most restrictive design soil class, provided that the minimum
vertical reinforcement is #4 spaced no more than 48 inches on center, and shall also
comply with the provisions of this section and the applicable provisions of Sections
R402.2 and R612 of the International Residential code.

When Tables R404.4(1) through R404.4(5) of the International Residential Code are
utilized for concrete foundation walls, reinforcement shall be as required for soil Group
IT1, as established by Table R405.1 of the International Residential Code, provided that

the minimum vertical Teinforcement 1§ #4 bar Spaced 1io ot than 48 o center: Where "~

Tables R404.4 (1) through R404.4 (5) of the International Residential Code indicate N/R
for vertical reinforcement size and spacing or where the Tables do not indicate the
maximum height of unbalanced backfill for various heights, vertical reinforcement and
spacing shall be provided as follows:

33

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Dac#; 242292v9



Mazximum Minimum Vertical Reinforcement Size and Spacing
unbalanced On Center
4’ and less #4 (@ 48"
5’ _ #4 @ 32 or #5 @ 48”
6’ #4 @ 20" or# 5 @ 327
7’ #4127 or #5 (@ 207
Chapter 5 Floors

Section R506 Concrete Floors (On Ground), Section R506.2 Site Preparation, Subsection
R506.2.3 Vapor Retarder is deleted in its entirety.

Chapter 6 Wall Construction

Section R606 General Masonry Construction, Subsection 606.12 Seismic Requirements,

Sub-subsection R606.12.2.2.3 Reinforcement Requirements for Masonry Elements

# 2 is amended to read as follows:
2. Vertical reinforcement of at least one #4 bar shall be provided at corners, within 16
inches of each side of openings, within 8 inches of each side of movement joints, within 8
inches of the ends of walls and at a maximum spacing of 48 inches.

Chapter 7 Wall Covering

Section R702 Interior Covering

Table R702.3.5 Minimum thickness and application of Gypsum Board, footnote d is deleted
in its entirety.

Chapter 9 Roof Assemblies

Subsection R905.3 Clay and concrete tile is amended to add Subsection R905.3.1 to read as
follows:

R905.3.1 Deck requirements. Clay and concrete tile shall be installed on solid
sheathing,

Subsection R905.4 Metal roof shingles is amended to add Subsection R905.4.1 to read as
follows:

R905.4.1 Deck requirements. Metal roof shingles shall be installed on solid sheathing,

Subsection R205.7 Wood shingles is amended to add Subsections R905.7.1 and R905.7.2t0
read as follows:

34

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Dasc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242252v9




R905.7.1 Wood shingles shall be installed on solid sheathing.
R905.7.2 Wood shingles shall be factory treated fire-retardant grade 1 minimum.

Subsection R905.8 Wood shakes is amended to add new Subsections R905.8.1 Deck
requirements and 905.8.2 Material standards to read as follows:

R905.8.1 Deck requirements. Wood shakes shail be installed on solid sheathing.

R905.8.2 Material standards. Wood shakes shall be factory fire-retardant treated grade
1 minimum.

Subsection R905.10 Metal roof panels is amended to add new Subsection R905.10.1 to
read as follows:

R905.10.1 Deck requirements. Metal roof panel coverings shall be installed on solid
sheathing.

Chapter 10 Chimneys and Fireplaces

Subsection R1004.1 GENERAL is amended to add a new second sentence and to read as
follows:

R1004.1 General. Factory-built fireplaces shall be listed and labeled and shall be install
in accordance with the conditions of the listing. Factory-built fireplaces shall be tested in
accordance with UL 127. All factory-built fireplaces shall comply with 40CFR60
Subpart AAA, Revised July 1, 2002. State clean air. ARS 9-500.16.

Chapter 13 General Mechanical System Requirements

Subsection M1307-Appliance Installation, Subsection M1307.3 Elevation of Ignition Source.

Exception is amended to read:
Exception: This shall not apply to the following appliances:
1. Clothes dryers or manufactured sealed ignition (pilot) systems installed in a

private garage.

Chapter 14 Heating and Cooling Equipment and Appliances

Section V1414 Fireplace stoves; Subsection M1414:1-Generalis-amended-to-add-anew
second sentence and to read as follows:

M1414.1 General. Fireplace stoves shall be listed, labeled and installed in accordance
with the terms of the listing, Fireplace stoves shall be tested in accordance with UL 737.
All factory-built fireplaces shall comply with 40CFR60 Subpart AAA, Revised July 1,

35

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codss 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v9



2002. State clean air, ARS 9-500.16

Chapter 24 Fuel Gas

Section G2415 (404) Piping system installation, Subsection G2415.5 Piping in concealed
locations is amended to read as follows:

G2415.5 Portions of a piping system installed in concealed locations shall not have
unions, tubing fittings, right and left couplings, bushings, compression couplings, and swing joints
made by combinations of fittings. Flexible gas piping shall not be used in exterior walls.

Chapter 29 Water Supply and Distribution

Section P2902 Protection of potable water supply, Subsection P2902.3 Backflow Protection,
Sub-subsection P2902.3.5 Reduced pressure principle backflow preventer assemblies is
amended to add a second paragraph to read as follows:

If only one backflow device is required to be installed on a system it shall be a reduced
pressure principle backflow preventer. If more than one backflow device is required to be
installed on a system the reduced pressure principle backflow preventer shall be installed
between the water meter and all other devices. The additional devices shall be as
Specified in Table P2902.3.

Subsection P2902.4 Protection of potable water outlets is amended by adding new Sections
P2902.4.4 and P2902.4.4.1 to read as follows:

P2902.4 Protection of potable water outlets. All connections to the potable water
system shall conform to Sections P2902.4.1 through 2902.5.6.

* k¥

P2902.4.4 Yard hydrant, Yard hydrants directly connected 1o the potable
water system shall be sanitary yard hydrants.

P2902.4.4.1. Hose Bibb Requirements. All dwelling units shall be
provided with a minimum of 2 exterior hose bibbs. Hose bibbs shall be
frost free, anti-siphon type.

IV.  The Town of Dewey-Humboldt, Arizona Code of Ordinances, Title XV Land
Usage, Chapter 150 Building Codes, Subchapter Codes Adopted, § 150.04 Plumbing Code, as
Amended is hereby repealed in its entirety and new § 150.04 Plumbing Code is adopted to read
as follows:

§ 150.04 Plumbing Code.
36

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Dosc: Adeption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doct: 242292v9




(A)  That certain code entitled “International Plumbing Code, 2012 Edition”, together with
Appendices D, E and F, published by the International Code Council i3 hereby adopted as the
Plumbing Code of the Town of Dewey-Humboldt and made part of this chapter, the same as
though said code with said named appendices and referenced standards were specifically set forth
in full herein, except as amended in Subsection 150.04( B) below.

(B) Amendments:

The International Plumbing Code shall be amended as follows:

Chapter 1 Scope and Administration

Section 101 General, Subsection 101.1 Title is amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Plumbing Code of the Town of
Dewey-Humboldt, hereinafter referred to as “this code”.

Sections 102 through 110 are deleted in their entirety. The requirements of the Dewey-
Humboldt Administrative Code, as adopted in § 150.01 shall apply.

Chapter 2 Definitions

Section 201 General, Subsection 201.4 Terms not defined is amended to read as follows:
201.4 Terms not defined. Where terms are not defined through the methods authorized
by this section, such terms shall have ordinarily accepted meanings such as the context
implies. Webster’s Third New International Dictionary of the English Langunage,

Unabridged shall be considered as providing ordinarily accepted meanings.

E‘—--Sec:ti0311720213(%1:1elci.aLD:e,}ﬂin&itlielrasf-isf-amendedrbfygamemdingJ:hc—uie,ﬁni‘[i,ojz,ma?i(lod‘C:,Ofﬁxcifﬂ” 0. .

read as follows:
CODE OFFICIAL. The officer or other designated authority charged with the
administration and enforcement of this code, or a duly authorized representative. The
Code Official shall be the Building Official as defined in the International Building Code.

Chapter 3 General Regulations

———————Section 305 Protection of Pipes and Plumbing System Components; Subsection 305.4—
' Freezing is amended to read as follows:

305.4 Freezing. Water, soil and waste pipes shall not be installed outside of a building,
in attics or crawl spaces, concealed in outside walls, or in any other place subjected to
freezing temperatures unless adequate provision is made to protect such pipes from

37

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc; Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v9



freezing by insulation or heat or both. Exterior water supply system piping shall be
installed not less than 6 inches (152 mm} below the frost line and not less than 12 inches
(305 mm) below grade. Minimum burial depth for Water, Soil and Waste Pipes is 12”.

305.4.1 Sewer depth. Sewer depth is 6” below frost line and a minimum depth of
127,

Chapter 4 Fixtures, Faucets and Fixture Fittings

Section 403 Minimum Plumbing Facilities, Section 403.1 Minimum Number of Fixtures,
Table 403.1 Minimum Number of Required Plumbing Fixtures is amended to add the
following footnotes:

h. Water coolers, Goose neck spigot at a non-restroom/utility sink, or bottled water
dispensers may be substituted for drinking fountains in B, M, and S occupancies
with 25 or fewer occupants. Such water facilities shall be free of charge and
accessible to the public.

i. Goose neck faucets on a lavatory or a hose bib located within a restroom may be
substituted for the required utility sink in B, M, and 8 occupancies with 25 or
fewer occupants, Hose bibs shall comply with Section 608.15.4.2 of the
International Plumbing Code.

Je Family or assisted-use toilet and bath fixtures restrooms shall consist of a
minimum a 117.1-2009 compliant toilet, lavatory sink, urinal and baby changing
table with accommodating accessible clearances per a 117.1-2009.

Chapter 6 Water Supply and Distribution

Section 603 Water Service is amended by amending Subsection 603.2 Separation of Water
Service and Building Sewer by adding a new Sub-subection 603.2.1 Burial Depth to read as

follows:

603.2.1 Burial Depth. The water service pipe shall be buried a minimum of
12”inches below finish grade and be covered with clean backfill free of sharp
rocks.
Section 606 Installation of the Building Water Distribution System, Subsection 606.1
Location of full-open valves is amended to delete installation location number 2.

Water Qutlets, Sub-subsection 608.15.4.2 Hose connections is amended to add a new
sentence at the end of the paragraph to read as follows:

608.15.4.2 Sillcocks, hose bibbs, wall hydrants and other openings with a hose
connection shall be protected by an atmospheric-type or pressure-type vacuum
38

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adeption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242252v9



breaker or a permanently attached hose connection vacuum breaker. Yard
hydrants connected to the potable water system shall be “sanitary yard hydrants”,

Exceptions:

1. This section shall not apply to water heater and boiler drain valves that are
provided with hose connection threads and that are intended only for tank or
vessel draining,

2. This section shall not apply to water supply valves intended for connection of
clothes washing machines where backflow prevention is otherwise provided or is
integral with the machine,

V. The Town of Dewey-Humboldt, Arizona Code of Ordinances, Title XV Land
Usage, Chapter 150 Building Codes, Subchapter Codes Adopted, § 150.05 Mechanical Code, as
Amended is hereby repealed in its entirety and new § 150.05 Mechanical Code is adopted to read
as follows:

§ 150.05 Mechanical Code

(A)  That certain code entitled “International Mechanical Code, 2012 Edition”, published by
the International Code Council, together with Appendix A is hereby adopted as the Mechanical
Code of the Town of Dewey-Humboldt and made part of this chapter, the same as though said

code and appendix were specifically set forth in full herein, except as amended in Subsection
150.05(B) below.

(B) Amendments;:

The International Mechanical Code is amended as follows:

) Chapter 1 Scope and Administration
Section 101 General, Subsection 101.1Title is amended to read as follows:

101 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Mechanical Code of the Town of
Dewey-Humboldt, hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

Sections 102 through 110 are deleted in their entirety. The requirements of the Town of

Dewey=Humbeldt Administrative Code,-as-adopted in-§-150.01_shall apply.
Chapter 2 Definitions

Section 201 General, Subsection 201.4 Terms not defined is amended to add a second
sentence to read as follows:

39

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Dese: Adoption of 2012 Tech Cedes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v9




201.4 Terms not defined. Where terms are not defined through the methods
authorized by this section, such terms shall have ordinarily accepted meanings such as
the context implies. Webster’s Third New International Dictionary of the English
Language, Unabridged shall be considered as providing ordinarily accepted meanings.

Section 202 General Definitions is amended by amending the definition of “Code Official” to
read as follows:

CODE OFFICIAL. The officer or other designated authority charged with the
administration and enforcement of this code, or a duly authorized representative. The
Code Official shall be the Building Official as defined in the Building Code of Dewey-
Humboldt.

Chapter 3 General Regulations

Section 301.2 Energy utilization is deleted in its entirety.

Section 303 Equipment and Appliance Location, Subsection 303.1 General is amended to
read as follows:

303.1 General. Appliance shall not be located in a hazardous location unless listed and
approved for the specific installation

Section 304 Installation, Subsection 304.3 Elevation of ignition source is amended to add an
exception thereto, to read as follows:

Exception: Clothes dryers installed in private garages.
Chapter 9 Specific Appliances, Fireplaces and Solid Fuel- Burning Equipment

Section 903, Factory built fireplaces, Subsection 903.1 General is amended to add a new

second sentence to read as follows:

903.1 General. Factory-built fireplaces shall be listed and labeled and shall be installed
in accordance with the conditions of the listing. Factory-built fireplaces shall be tested in
accordance with UL 127. All factory-built fireplaces shall comply with 40CFR60 subpart
AAA, Revised July 1, 2002.

Section 904 Pellet fuel-burning appliances, Subsectlon 904.1 General is amended to add a

fiew second sentence to read ay follows: -
904.1 General. Pellet fuel-burning appliances shall be listed and labeled in accordance

with ASTM E 1509 and shall be installed in accordance with the terms of the listing, All
factory-built fireplaces shall comply with 40CFR60 Subpart AAA, Revised July 1, 2002,

40

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doo#: 242292v9



Section 905 Fireplace stoves and room heaters, Subsection 905.1 General” is amended to
add a new fourth sentence to read as follows:

905.1 General. Fireplace stoves and solid-fuel-type room heaters shall be listed and
labeled and shall be installed in accordance with the conditions of the listing. Fireplace
stoves shall be tested in accordance with UL 737. Solid-fuel-type room heaters shall be
tested in accordance with UL 1482. Fireplace inserts intended for installation in
fireplaces shall be listed and labeled in accordance with the requirements of UL 1482 and
shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s installation instructions. All
factory-built fireplaces shall comply with 40CFR60 subpart AAA, Revised July 1, 2002,

V1.  The Town of Dewey-Humboldt, Arizona Code of Ordinances, Title XV Land
Usage, Chapter 150 Building Codes, Subchapter Codes Adopted, § 150.06 Electrical Code, as
Amended is hereby repealed in its entirety and new § 150.06 Electrical Code is adopted to read
as follows:

§ 150.06 Electrical Code

(A) That certain code entitled “ICC Electrical Code, Administrative Provisions, 2006 Edition, as
published by the International Code Council and National Electrical Code, 2011 Edition,
published by the National Fire Protection Association, three copies or one copy and one electronic
copy of which are filed and maintained in the office of the Town Clerk, and as amended in
Subsections 150.06(B) and (C), are hereby adopted as the Electrical Code of the Town of
Dewey-Humboldt for regulating the design, construction, quality of materials, erection,
installation, alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance
of electrical systems as herein provided; providing for the issvance of permits and collection of
fees therefor. Said codes are made part of this chapter, the same as though they were specifically
set forth in full herein.

~ (B) Amendments to the ICC Electrical Code:

The ICC Electrical Code, 2006 Edition is amended as follows:
Chapter 1 Scope
Section 101General, Subsection 101.1 Title is amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations together with the National Electrical Code and
Amendments thereto shall be known as the Electrical Code of the Town of Dewey-

Humboldt, hereinafter referred to as “this code.”
Chapter 2 Definitions
Section 201 General, Subsection 201.4 Terms not defined is amended to read as follows:

41

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Cedes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v9




201.4 Terms not defined. Where terms are not defined through the methods authorized
by this section, such terms shall have ordinarily accepted meanings such as the context
implies. “Webster’s Third New International Dictionary of the English Language,
Unabridged shall be considered as providing ordinarily accepted meanings”.

(C) Amendments to The National Electric Code, 2011 Edition
The National Electric Code, 2011 Edition is amended as follows:
Article 90 Introduction, Subsection 90.1 Purpose, Subparagraph (A), Practical
Safeguarding is amended by adding the following text, to read as follows:
90.1 Purpose
(A) Safeguarding. The purpose of this Code is the practical safeguarding of persons and
property from hazards arising from the use of electricity. Any and all electrical work for
light, heat, power or any other purpose shall be installed in conformity with the rules and
regulations as set forth in the National Electrical Code, 2011 edition as amended herein,
and in conformity with the rules and regulations set forth by the Building Official.
Chapter 1 General

Article 100 Definitions, Subsection Scope is amended to add the following text to the end of the
first paragraph to read as follows:

Scope.

Where terms are not defined through the methods authorized by this section such

terms shall have ordinarily accepted meanings such as the-context implies: Webster™s
Third New International dictionary of the English Language, Unabridged, shall be
considered as providing ordinarily accepted meanings and terms shall have their
ordinarily accepted meanings within the context with which they are used.

* % ok

Article 110 Requirements for Electrical Installations, Part 1 General, Subsection
110.8, Wiring Methods, is deleted in its entirety and replaced by the following:

110.8 Wiring Methods

(A)  New Construction. Only wiring methods recognized as suitable are included in
this National Electrical Code. The recognized methods of wiring shall be permitted to be
installed in any type of building or occupancy, except as otherwise provided in this

42

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Techi Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Docif: 242292v9




National Electrical Code.

(B)  Existing or Relocated Building and Structures.

(1)  The provisions contained in this Article shall apply to all existing or
relocated buildings if the wiring methods in such buildings are deemed to be
inadequate or unsafe by the Building Official. If the existing wiring methods are
deemed to be adequate or unsafe, then application of this National Electrical Code
to existing or relocated buildings shall apply.

(2)  All relocated buildings or structures shall have service equipment which
conforms to the provisions of Article 230 Services of this Code.

(3)  Additions to or alterations in existing wiring must first be approved by the
Building Official.

(4) Each room in a relocated dwelling shall be provided with not less than two
equally-spaced convenience outlets. Receptacles which are a part of a fixture or

switch outlet shall not be counted as convenience outlets.

Article 210 Branch Circuits, Section 210.8 Ground-fault Circuit-Interrupter Protection for
Personnel; Dwelling Units is amended as follows:

1. The title is amended to read as follows:
Ground-fault Circuit-Interrupter Protection for Personnel; All Occupancies,

2, New Subsection (A)9) to read as follows:

(9)-Within-6-feet-of-any-sink-or-wash-basin.—

3. Subsections (B), (B)(1), and (B)(2) and the exception thereto are deleted.

Article 230 Services is amended to add a new Subsection 230.63 to read as follows:

230.63 Location. All service equipment rated 1000 amperes or more located inside a
" building shall be enclosed within a room or space separated from the rest of the building

by not less than a one-hour fire-resistive fire barrier walls or horizontal assemblies or
both. :

Article 250 Grounding and Bonding, Subsections 250. 118 Types of Equipment Grounding,
Sub-subsections (4) through (8) are amended to read as follows:

4, Electrical metallic tubing with an individual equipment-grounding conductor.
43

File: 1908-003-0000-0004; Desc: Adeption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v9



5. Flexible metal conduit, with an individual equipment-grounding conductor, where
both the conduit and fittings are listed for grounding.

6. Listed flexible metal conduit that is not listed for grounding, with individual
equipment grounding conductor, and meeting all the following conditions. (a., b., ¢. and d.
to remain the same.)

7. Flexible metallic tubing with individual equipment grounding conductor and
meeting all the following conditions. (A. and B, to remain the same.)

8. Armor of type AC cable with an individual equipment-grounding conductor and
as provided in Section 333-21.

Chapter 4 Equipment for General Use

Article 408 Switchboards and Panel boards, Part 1ll, Panel boards, Subsection 408.30
General, is amended to add a new paragraph to the end, to read as follows:

Fach separate commercial unit in a shopping center or building, each separate unit in an
apartment building, and any separate store, apartment, or dwelling shall have separate
lighting and /or power distribution panels. Such panels shall not serve other units of the
building. Hotels, motels, hotel apariments and similar types of buildings may be wired
from one or more distribution panels.

VII.  The Town of Dewey-Humboldt, Arizona Code of Ordinances, Title XV Land
Usage, Chapter 150 Building Codes, Subchapter Codes Adopted, § 150.07 Fuel Gas Code, as
Amended is hereby repealed in its entirety and new § 150.07 Fuel Gas Code is adopted to read
as follows:

§150.07 Fuel Gas-Code——————- = e — S — .

(A) That certain code entitled “International Fuel Gas Code, 2012 Edition,” together with
Appendices A, B, and C thereto, published by the International Code Council, is hereby adopted
as the Fuel Gas Code of the Town of Dewey-Humboldt for regulating and governing fuel gas
systems and gas-fired appliances in the town, and made a part of this chapter, the same as
though said code with named appendices were specifically set forth in full herein, except as the
same is amended as set forth in Subsection 150.07(B), below. At least three copies or one copy
and one electronic copy of said code and appendices shall be filed in the office of the town clerk

and kept available foruse and inspection: - -
(B) Amendments.

The International Fuel Gas Code, 2012 Edition is amended as follows:

44

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doctt: 242292v9




Chapter 1 Scope and Administration
Section 101 (IFGC) General, Subsection 101.1 Title is amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as Fuel Gas Code of the
Town of Dewey-Iumboldt, hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

Seetion 102 through 110 are deleted in their entirety and replaced with the requirements of the
Dewey-Humboldt Administrative Code, as adopted, and as may be amended from time to time.

Chapter 2 Definitions

Section 201 (IFGC) General, Subsection 201.4 Terms not defined is amended to read as
follows:

201.1 Terms not defined. Where terms are not defined through the methods authorized
by this section, such terms shall have ordinarily accepted as meaning such as the context
implics. Webster’s Third New International Dictionary of the English Language,
Unabridged, shall be considered as providing ordinarily accepted meanings.

Section 202 General Definitions is amended by amending the definitions of “Approved”,
“Approved Agency”, and “Occupancy” and to add a definition of “Code Official” to read as
follows:

APPROVED. Acceptable to the building official based upon investigation and tests
conducted by the building official, or by reason of accepted principles of tests by
recognized authorities, technical or scientific organization.

APPROVED AGENCY. An established and recognized agency that is regularly
engaged in conducting tests or furnishing inspection services and approved by the

Building Official

CODE OFFICIAL. The Building Official as defined in the International Building
Code.

OCCUPANCY. The purpose for which a building, or part thereof, is used or intended to
be used. '

Chapter 3 General Regulations

Section 303 (IFGC) Appliance Locations, Subsection 303.1General is amended to add a
sentence, to read as follows:

303.1 General. Appliances shall be located as required by this section, specific
requirements elsewhere in this code and the conditions of the equipment and appliance

45

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Dese: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v9



listing. Appliances shall not be located in a hazardous location, unless listed and approved
for the specific installation.

Section 310 (IFGS) Electrical Bonding, Subsection 310.1 Pipe and Tubing other than CSST
is amended to add a new sentence to read as follows:

310.1 Pipe and Tubing other than CSST. Each above-ground portion of a gas piping
system other than corrugated stainless steel tubing (CSST) that is likely to become
energized shall be electrically continuous and bonded to an effective ground-fault current
path. Gas piping other than CSST shall be considered to be bonded where it is connected
to appliances that are connected to the equipment grounding conductor of the circuit
supplying that appliance. Underground ferrous gas piping shall be electrically isolated
from the rest of the gas system with listed or approved isolation fittings installed a
minimum of six (6) inches above grade.

Chapter 4 Gas Piping Installation

Section 404 (IFGS) Piping System Installation, Subsections 404.5 Piping in concealed
locations and 404,12 Minimum Burial Depth are amended to read as follows:

404.5 Piping in concealed locations. Flexible gas piping shall not be used in
exterior walls.

404,12 Minimum Burial Depth. Underground piping systems shall be installed a
minimum depth of 18 inches below grade except as provided for in Section 404.12.1.

Section 406 (IFGS) Inspection, Testing and Purging, Subsection 406.4.1 Test Pressure is
deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following:

406.4.1 Test Pressure. The test pressure to be used shall be no less than 1 % times the

proposed maximum working pressure, but not less than 10 psig, irrespective of design

pressure. Where the test pressure exceeds 125 psig, the test pressure shall not exceed a
value that produces a hoop stress in the piping greater than 50 percent of the specified
minimum yield strength of the pipe.

Section 409 (IFGS) Shutoff Valves, Subsection 409.1 General, Sub-subsection 409.1.3
Access to Shutoff Valves is amended to read as follows:

409.1.3 Access to shutoff valves, Shutoff valves shall be located in places so as to provide

shall be provided with a shutoff valve located at the point of entrance to the building on
the downstream side of the gas meter or supply source. Multiple buildings on the same
system shall have a separate shutoff valve for each building.

Chapter 6 Specific Appliances
46

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v6

access foroperationrand shall be installed so-astobe protected from-damage.-AH buildings———---——~




Section 602 (IFGC) Decorative Appliances for Installation in Fireplaces is hereby amended
by adding Subsection 602.4 Gas Logs to read as follows:

602.4 Gas Logs. Approved gas logs installed in solid-fuel-burning fireplaces shall
comply with the following:

1. The gas log shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s
installation Instructions.

2, If the fireplace is equipped with a damper, it shall be permanently blocked
open to a sufficient amount to prevent spillage of combustion products
into the room.

3. The minimum flue passageway shall not be less than 1 square inch per
2,000 Btu/h input.

4, Gas logs, when equipped with a pilot shall have a listed safety shutoff
valve.

Chapter 7 Gascous Hydrogen Systems

All Interpretation and Enforcement of Chapter 7 shall be delegated to the Central Yavapai Fire
District. '

VIII. The Town of Dewey-Humboldt, Arizona Code of Ordinances, Title XV Land
Usage, Chapter 150 Building Codes. Subchapter Codes Adopted, § 150.08 Property Maintenance
Code, as Amended is hereby repealed in its entirety and new § 150.08 Property Maintenance
Code is adopted to read as follows:

,5,7,_“_*§r15,0,.0,8,Bmpex:tngaintenance,@o,de. :

(A) That certain code entitled “International Property Maintenance Code, 2012 Edition”, as
published by the International Code Council is hereby adopted as the Property Maintenance
Code of the Town of Dewey-Humboldt for regulating and governing the conditions and
maintenance of all property, buildings and structures; by providing the standards for supplied
utilities and facilities and other physical things and conditions essential to ensure that structures
are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use; and the condemnation of buildings and
structures unfit for human occupancy and use, and the demolition of such existing structures in
e —.__the town, and made a_part of this chapter, the same_as though said_code with was specifically set

forth in full herein, except as the same is amended as set forth in Subsection 150.08(B}), below.
At least three copies or one copy and one electronic copy of said code shall be filed in the office
of the town clerk and kept available for use and inspection.

(B) Amendments.

47

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v8



The International Property Maintenance Code, 2012 Edition, is amended as follows:
Chapter 1 Scope and Administration

Part 1 Scope and Application, Section 101 General, Subsection 101.1 Title is amended to
read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Property Maintenance Code of the
Town of Dewey-Humboldt, hereinafter referred to as “this code.

Section 102 Applicability, Subsection 102.3 Application of Other Codes is amended to read
as follows:

Section 102.3 Application of Other Codes. Repairs, additions or alterations to a
structure, ot changes of occupancy, shall be done in accordance with the procedures and
provisions of the International Building Code, International Energy Conservation Code,
International Fire Code, International Fuel Gas Code, International Mechanical Code,
International Residential Code, International Plumbing Code and NFPA 70. Nothing in
this code shall be construed to cancel, modify or set aside any provision of the
International Zoning Code or International Residential Code.

Section 103 Department of Property Maintenance Inspection is deleted in its entirety.
Section 106 Violations is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following:

106 Violations. The requirements of the Town of Dewey-Humboldt Administrative
Code, as adopted in § 150.01 shall apply.

Section 111 Means of Appeal is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following:

111 Means of Appeal. The requirements of the Town of Dewey-Humboldt
Administrative Code, as adopted in § 150.01 shall apply.

_Chapter 2 Definitions

Section 201 General, Subsection 201.3 Terms not defined in other codes and Section 201.4
Terms not defined are amended to read as follows:

Section 201.3 Terms not defined in other codes. Where terms are not defined in this
code and are defined in the International Conservation code, the international building
code, international residential code, international fuel gas code, international mechanical
code, or international plumbing code such term shall have the meanmgs ascribed to them

Section 201.4 Terms not defined. Where terms are not defined through the methods
authorized by this section, such terms shall have ordinarily accepted as meaning such as
the context implies. Webster’s Third New International Dictionary of the English
Language, Unabridged, shall be considered as providing ordinarily accepted meanings.

48

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v0

d__...ln thOSG codes e et o e M £ . . et 4 1 s+ s b . o4 12 o 1 e St st —— e




Section 202 General Definitions is amended by amending the definitions of “Approved”,
“Approved Agency”, “Occupancy”, and “Rubbish” to read as follows:

APPROVED. Approval by the Building Official based on investigation and tests
conducted by the Building Official, or by reason of accepted principles of tests by
recognized authorities, technical or scientific organization.

APPROVED AGENCY. An established and recognized agency regularly engaged in
conducting tests or furnishing inspection services that has been approved by the Building
Official.

OCCUPANCY. The purpose for which a building, or part thereof, is used or intended to
be used.

RUBBISH. Combustible and noncombustible waste materials, except garbage; the term
shall include the residue from the burning of wood, coal, coke and other combustible
materials, paper, rags, cartons, boxes, wood, excelsior, rubber, leather, tree branches,
yard trimmings, tin cans, metals, mineral matter, glass, crockery and dust and other
similar materials. For the purposes of this Property Maintenance Code, without
expanding the definition above, the term *“rubbish” encompasses any reference in A.R.S,
$ 9-499 to trash, debris, or accumulation of filth.

Chapter 3 General Requirements

Section 302 Exterior Property Areas is amended as follows:

Subsection 302.3 Sidewalks and Driveways is amended to insert an Exception to read
as follows:

Exception; Single Family Residential:—
Subsection 302.4 Weeds is deleted in its entirety.
Subsection 302.5 Rodent harborage is deleted in its entirety.

Subsection 302.8 Motor Vehicles is deleted in its entirety.

Section 303 Sw_mlnlmg pools, spas a_l_ld hot tubs is _deleted_j__n its e_:frgi‘_l_'_‘q_t_y:____

Section 304 Exterior Structure is amended as follows:

Subsection 304.2 Protective treatment is deleted in its entirety.

Subsection304.7 Roofs and drainage is amended to delete the words “free from
49

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Dese: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doc#: 242292v9




obstruction,”

Subsection 304.9 Overhang extensions is amended to delete the second sentence in its
entirety starting with the words “When required”.

Subsection 304.13 Window, skylight and door frames is deleted in its entirety.
Subsection 304.14 Insect screens is deleted in its entirety.
Subsection 304.15 Doors is deleted in its entirety.
Subsection 304,16 Basement Hatchways is deleted in its entirety.
Subsection 304.17 Guards for Basement Windows is deleted in its entirety.
Subsection 304.18 Building Security is deleted in its entirety.
Section 305 Interior Structure is amended as follows:
Subsection 305.3 Interior Surfaces is deleted in its entirety.
Subsection 305.6 Interior Doors is amended by deleted in its entirety.

Section 307 Handrails and guardrails, Subsection 307.1 Accumulation of rubbish or
garbage is deleted in its entirety and replaced by the following:

307.1 Accumulation of rubbish or garbage. All exterior property, premises, buildings,
grounds, lots, contiguous sidewalks, streets, and alleys shall be free from an accumulation
of rubbish or garbage that: (1) constitute a hazard to public health and safety; or (2) are
large than three feet in diameter.

Section 308 Rubbish and Garbage, Subsection 308.4 Dumping is added to read as follows:

308.4 Dumping. Any person, firm or corporation that places any rubbish or garbage
upon any private or public property not owned or under the control of that person, firm or
corporation is guilty of a class 1 misdemeanor or a civil violation, or both; and in addition
to any fine or penalty which may be imposed for a violation of any provision of this
section, is liable for all costs which may be assessed pursuvant to this section for
removing, abating or enjoining the rubbish or garbage.

Section 309 Pest Elimination is deleted in its entirety.
Chapter 4 Light Ventilation and Occupancy Limitations is deleted in its entirety.

Chapter 6 Mechanical and Electrical Requirements
50

File: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Docd#; 242292v9




Section 604 Electrical Facilities, Subsection 604.2 Service is amended to delete ICC electrical
Codes and replace with National Electrical Code 2011, Edition to read as follows:

604.2 Service. The size and usage of appliances and equipment shall serve as a basis for
determining the need for additional facilities in accordance with NFPA 70. Dwelling
units shall be served by a three-wire, 120/240 volt, single-phase electrical service having
a minimum rating of 60 amperes.

IX. The Town of Dewey-Humboldt, Arizona Code of Ordinances, Title XV Land-
Usage, Chapter 150 Building Codes, Subchapter Codes Adopted, § 150.11 Effective Date is
hereby repealed in its entirety and the section number is reserved for future use.

51

Tile: 1908-003-0000-0000; Desc: Adoption of 2012 Tech Codes 2012 Final 12-22-15; Doct: 242292v9




